Jillian Barden

From: Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 4:06 PM

To: Jillian Barden

Subject: Re: Fwd: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (Quarter 1

(January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

See Attached

On Fri, May 31 at 11:36, Consortium wrote:
Please see WM update.
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com>

Date: May 31, 2024 at 9:03:19 AM CDT

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (Quarter 1 (January -
March)) - Assessment Inquiry

They have been a problem from day one,

If they are putting out their cart we are dumping it - if not that is their problem.

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 8:55 AM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (Quarter 1 (January -
March)) - Assessment Inquiry

Mary,



Please see the information and request from Jillian.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 8:54 AM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: 1223 Farrington St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment
Inquiry

Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 1223 Farrington St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117. Please forward to
Waste Management for their input.

Ticket ID#: 574352

Ticket Requester: Carol Broos

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16514894622
Property ID #: 242923430130

Property Address: 1223 Farrington St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 1 (January - March)
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Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2024

Pending Assessment Amount: $86.49

Hauler: Waste Management

Ticket Comments:

"Refusal for Cause Without Dishonor and, recourse to me as per the Uniform Commercial Code"

Please provide the following information:

e Can you verify they have been receiving service during Q1

I'm learning all about this case. There's a lot of history to it

Thank you,

Jillian

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us

stpaul.gov/garbage




