Mai Vang

From: Marcia Moermond

Sent: Thursday, December 18, 2025 11:30 AM
To: Joanna Zimny; Mai Vang

Subject: Fw: 430 Dale

Attachments: Invoice 2172.pdf

Get Outlook for Android

From: Sean Westenhofer <sean.westenhofer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Wednesday, December 17, 2025 10:43:13 AM

To: James Hoffman <james.hoffman@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Marcia Moermond <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Fw: 430 Dale

Checking to see if more pics were taken.

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Bert Windhorst <bert@snowremovalgroup.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 17, 2025 10:36

To: Sean Westenhofer <sean.westenhofer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: 430 Dale

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Sean,

Attached are photos and the invoice for 430 Dale






Bert Windhorst

Chief Operating Officer
612.382.5968 Direct
952.994.7669 Office
SnowRemovalGroup.com
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