Clare Pillsbury

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, August 11, 2023 4:36 PM

To: Sarah Haas

Cc: Clare Pillsbury

Subject: Fwd: 900 Westminster St St Paul Parcel #292922320127

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Sarah,
Please see the information and request from Mary.

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com>

Date: August 11, 2023 at 4:18:31 PM CDT

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: 900 Westminster St St Paul Parcel #292922320127

Please take off $71.43 of the $133.87 that we sent to the city/county for certification — 2" Qtr 2023.
This is the previous owner’s account and it wasn’t canceled when the new owner signed up for service
as of 5.14.23.

The balance for certification should now be $62.44 — for service from 4.1.23 to 5.13.23 — 96 gal trash
service, taxes and 1 % finance charges of $8.73

Thanks

Mary Patch
Sales Coordinator
Public Sector

mpatch@wm.com

1901 Ames Dr
Burnsville, MN 55306

Access WM 24/7 with MywWM
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Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



