
From: Tanya Panzer
To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
Cc: Mai Vang
Subject: RE: 2185 Ford Parkway: Assessment Notice - Request Credit
Date: Thursday, December 28, 2023 9:08:04 AM
Attachments: DSI 2023 SecEmer Boarding July Assessmt Response & Support 12-23-23.pdf

There were to separate assessments –
J2401B/248100 Securing and/or Emergency Boarding May 2023 $ 474.00. This amount was paid in
fill on 7/25/2023 by 2185 Ford Parkway LLC.
J2403B/248102 Securing and/or Emergency Boarding July 2023 $ 474.00.
 
 

From: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Sent: Thursday, December 28, 2023 8:12 AM
To: Tanya Panzer <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Mai Vang <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 2185 Ford Parkway: Assessment Notice - Request Credit
 
Can you check on this.  Thanks.
 
Mai
 

From: Thomas Laird <lairdthomas@comcast.net> 
Sent: Wednesday, December 27, 2023 2:41 PM
To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Thomas Laird <lairdthomas@comcast.net>
Subject: 2185 Ford Parkway: Assessment Notice - Request Credit
 
I write regarding the above and Assessment #248102, File #J2403B to secure and
emergency boarding of the structure. Attached please find evidence of previous
payment and, thus, our request to credit and not charge additional fees.
 
I welcome a discussion to better understand and can be reached at this email
address or 651-414-9552.
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