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Lydia Campbell

From: Lydia (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>
Sent: Sunday, December 17, 2023 5:38 PM
To: Lydia Campbell
Subject: Re: FW: 1128 4th St E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 4 (October - December)) - Assessment 

Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 

fwd 

 

On Tue, November 7 at 16:42, Consortium wrote:  

Please see Aspen update. 

  

Greg Revering  

Chief Manager 

St. Paul Haulers LLC. 

grevering.sph@gmail.com  

  

763-295-2054 

  

From: Stacey Sanders <ssanders@aspenwaste.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, November 7, 2023 4:17 PM 

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 

Cc: Cydnee Bauman <cbauman@aspenwaste.com> 

Subject: RE: 1128 4th St E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 4 (October - December)) - Assessment Inquiry 

  

Greg 

It has been discovered that this amount was sent to the city in error.  I will take care of adjustments accordingly on 

my end if you could please share this with the city and the resident 
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Thank you  

  

  

Stacey Sanders  

Aspen Waste Systems  

Office Operations Manager  

612-884-8017 

ssanders@aspenwaste.com  

  

 

  

  

  

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, November 7, 2023 1:05 PM 

To: Stacey Sanders <ssanders@aspenwaste.com> 

Cc: Cydnee Bauman <cbauman@aspenwaste.com> 

Subject: FW: 1128 4th St E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 4 (October - December)) - Assessment Inquiry 

  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless 

you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  

Stacey, 

Please see the information and request from Lydia. 

  

Greg Revering  

Chief Manager 
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St. Paul Haulers LLC. 

grevering.sph@gmail.com  

  

763-295-2054 

  

From: Lydia (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, November 7, 2023 11:14 AM 

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: 1128 4th St E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 4 (October - December)) - Assessment Inquiry 

  

Hello,  

   

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 1128 4th St E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55106. Please forward to Aspen for 

their input.   

   

Ticket ID#: 246063 

Ticket Requester: Pheng Xiong 

Ticket Requester Email: (if available) penniiexiong18@gmail.com 

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16512072720 

Property ID #: 332922130116  

Property Address:  1128 4th St E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55106  

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 4 (October - December) 

Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2023  

Pending Assessment Amount: $20.66  

Hauler: Aspen  

Ticket Comments:   

   

PO states that they paid their bill on time and the assessed amount is for a late fee that they should not owe. See 

attached image showing payment made to Aspen on 7/11/2023 
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Please also provide the following information:  

 Name and mailing address on the account  

 Itemized breakdown of invoice  

 Payment history  

 Contact with property owner  

   

   

   

Thank you,  

   

Lydia Campbell  

---  

City of Saint Paul  

Department of Public Works - Garbage  

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us  

stpaul.gov/garbage  

                                                                                                      Conversation ID: 0b0a8542-7d91-11ee-8597-014f5a462171 0b0a8542-7d91-11ee-8597-014f5a462171 03c10c1  

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential and may be subject to legal or 

other professional privilege. It is intended solely for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you 

are not the intended recipient(s), you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action 

in relation to and/or relying on the contents of this the email or its attachments (or any part thereof), is strictly 

prohibited and may be unlawful. Any confidentiality or privilege is not waived or lost because this email has been 

sent to you by mistake. We have taken reasonable precautions to reduce the risk of transmitting viruses, but do not 

accept liability for any loss or damage caused by this email or its attachments due to viruses, interference, 

interception, corruption or unapproved access.  


