Lydia Campbell

From: Lydia (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Monday, February 5, 2024 9:10 AM

To: Lydia Campbell

Subject: Re: Fwd: 2024 Reaney Ave E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55119 - (Quarter 4 (October - December)) -

Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

fwd
On Fri, January 26 at 9:44, Consortium wrote:
Please see Republic request.

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Estrella, Frances" <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Date: January 26, 2024 at 9:27:25 AM CST

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: "Mathiasen, Beverly" <BMathiasen@republicservices.com>

Subject: RE: 2024 Reaney Ave E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55119 - (Quarter 4 (October - December)) -
Assessment Inquiry

Please remove the certification. Thanks

Frances Estrella

Billing Coordinator

11380 Courthouse Blvd

Inver Grove Heights

e festrella@republicservices.com
o 651.286.4588

w RepublicServices.com
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Sustainability in Action

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 25, 2024 5:39 PM

To: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Cc: Mathiasen, Beverly <BMathiasen@republicservices.com>

Subject: FW: 2024 Reaney Ave E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55119 - (Quarter 4 (October - December)) -
Assessment Inquiry

This Message Is From an External Sender

Report Suspicious

This message came from outside your organization.

Frances,

Please see the information and request from Sarah.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com




763-295-2054

From: Sarah (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, January 25, 2024 5:22 PM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: 2024 Reaney Ave E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55119 - (Quarter 4 (October - December)) -
Assessment Inquiry

Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 2024 Reaney Ave E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55119. Please forward to
Republic Services for their input.

Ticket ID#: 387598

Ticket Requester: Margaret Anne Priola

Ticket Requester Email: (if available) markduret@yahoo.com

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) 16124628172

Property ID #: 262922430178
Property Address: 2024 Reaney Ave E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55119

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 4 (October - December)

Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2023
Pending Assessment Amount: $119.89
Hauler: Republic Services

Ticket Comments: PO says he already paid his two Q3 and Q4 bills to the hauler in August and November.



Please provide the following information:
« Name and mailing address on the account
e Itemized breakdown of invoice

e« Payment history
e Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Sarah

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us

stpaul.gov/garbage






