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Lydia Campbell July 2, 2024 at 14:14

 

FYI

 

Lydia Campbell (she/her)

Garbage Program Supervisor | City of Saint Paul

lydia.campbell@ci.stpaul.mn.us | 651-266-6130

 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com> Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2024 1:22 PM To: Sarah
Haas <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Lydia Campbell <Lydia.Campbell@ci.stpaul.mn.us> Subject: FW: 1042
Hague Ave

 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.
 

Lydia,

Please see request from Frances.

 

Greg Revering

Chief Manager

St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

 

763-295-2054

 

From: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com> Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2024 1:17 PM To:
grevering.sph@gmail.com Subject: 1042 Hague Ave
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Hello,

        Please remove certification for Q1 2024, should never have been sent to the city.

 

Thanks,

 

Frances Estrella 
Municipal Administrator

 

10729 Town Square Dr NE Ste 180

Blaine, MN 55449

e  festrella@republicservices.com

o  612.464.2723

c  612.5164833

w  RepublicServices.com
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