Mai Vang

From: giaoduyenus@yahoo.com
Sent: Monday, April 14, 2025 9:30 PM
To: *Cl-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
Subject: Re: appealed tax assessment for 650 Blair Ave
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Ronald Mendoza 650 Blair

Tue, Jan 14 at 7118 AM

Hi Ronald, did you re-

move the chair the city
noticed yet ?

Hi Ronald, need to re-

move this chair, city of
st.paul will charge $450
per hour plus so please

Yes | removed or ready. take care of it

It's not mine, someone
Thank you went and put it there.
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You welcome NESEEPE

Tue, Jan 14 at 9:28 AM
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{n violation 6f Chapter 45 .
1. Remove improperly stored or accumulated refuse which may hﬁd::ﬁﬁ

attered litter, discarded furniture, appliances, parts, scrap w
:HM.WHMMMMHMM tires, brush, €1,
including yard, boulevard, alley, and driveway. e R

FLEASE REMOVE AND PROPERLY DISPOSE OF THE SOFA CHAIR AND OFFICE CHAIR
OF THE PROPERTY AND THE PROPERTY. THANK YOL.

Comply before: January 13, 2025
Questions: Call your Inspector David Smith
Phone Number: G51- 266- 8005

Thank you - we appreclate your cooperation! Phata may not show all areas which need to be aba

If you o mot correct the misance or file an appeal before Jamary
13, 2025, the City will correct the nuisance angd eharge all coss,
ncluding boarding costs, apainst the property as & special
issessement 1o be collected in the same way as property laxes.

1f the City coarects the muisance, the chasges will include
lhe cost of correction, inspection, travel ime, qqmmm? eic. The
::‘r“ wiil f:"d.l'iﬂ-l'ﬂ-ﬂ'ﬂ?-'lh'h' S450 per hour plus expenses for

gurdlopl

"PEALS: You may appeal this erder and obrain & hwaring before

‘Legislative Heariog Odficer by completing an appeal application

wre the deadiine noded above or seven (7) davs after the date

cd, wiichever oomes first.  No appeals may be filed afrer that
You may abtain an appeal application from the Ciry Clerk's

jbi’}?;s]-j t}rr:'uyn'!'ad'l. Isb W. Kellogg Bhvel., St Paul, iy 55102

266 % You musr submit a copy i T Wi

e 3 Py of this Order with your

Nz I vielations are not corrected by the compl

“casts will be assessed to the Property :am:r:i::ﬁ;:gﬂr;]ﬁ;;d
If additional new violations are discovered within the

onths, additional charge may apply.

# Duyon Pham 12125 Marrin 5t Nw Coon Rapids MN 55445. 1995
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HiJoanna,

This is the pictures of noticed and texted between me and my renter.

He said that not him, some people put there many time, and when he saw note, he just looked by picture in the
letter of city of Saint Paul just one chair in picture, that why he move only that one.

| apologize for late email, because I’'m don’t know how to send pictures with email together, waiting on my kids
help me.

Thank you Joanna

On Mar 31, 2025, at 4:13 PM, giaoduyenus@yahoo.com wrote:

Hi Joanna, | think you mistake to type my phone, number is 6513434037 not 4067

Thank you
Sent from my iPhone



On Mar 31, 2025, at 2:47 PM, *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
<LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Good afternoon,

This emailis to confirm that your appealed tax assessment for property at 650
BLAIR AVENUE. (File No. J5271R, Assessment No. 258530) is scheduled for
Tuesday, April 15, 2025 via phone between 9 and 11 am.

Attached are documents related to your appeal. If you have any documents you
would like added to the file you can reply to this email and send them to me. It does
look like you or your tenants did address the sofa chair from the original orders,
however the office chair was still there when the work crew arrived.

We will call you into the hearing at 651-343-4067 (you will not receive a separate link to
join nor be able to join yourself, we will simply be calling you),

Please note that the incoming number from the City shows up as 612-315-7905.

Thank you,
Joanna
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