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Jillian Barden

From: Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Wednesday, June 4, 2025 5:06 PM
To: Jillian Barden
Subject: Re: Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 

see attached 

 

On Thu, May 29 at 13:17, Consortium wrote:  
Please see WM update  
Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com> 

Date: May 28, 2025 at 9:36:12 AM CDT 

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE:  Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry 

  

I have credited off the $9.48 in finance charges and removed that amount from our Holding Acct   

  

She would still owe $63.18  

  

Mary Patch  

  

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, May 27, 2025 3:38 PM 

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry 

  

Mary, 

Please see request below  
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Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage)" <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

Date: May 27, 2025 at 10:52:50 AM CDT 

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry 

Reply-To: Public Works Garbage <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

  

can we waive late fees on this account? 

 

                                                                                                      C onversati on ID:  d1fb1e81- 221e-11f0-a01c- 7a8463f376fd a3bb44e0-3b12-11f0-9182- 4b612b455310 03c10c1On Mon, May 19 at 9:45, City of Saint Paul garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us wrote: 

Is there an update on this? 

 

On Wed, May 14 at 11:09, City of Saint Paul garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us wrote: 

PO responded with this email a few minutes ago.  

  

Can we please waive late fees? It sounds like the payment was never cashed, even though the bank sent it 

on Jan 16 

  

<image001.png> 

  

 

On Tue, May 13 at 17:17, City of Saint Paul garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us wrote: 

This is what I received, can you please resend it in a  word doc, pdf or other commonly used format? 

<image002.png> 

  

 

On Tue, May 13 at 17:15, Consortium wrote: 

Please see WM update. 
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Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com> 

Date: May 12, 2025 at 7:56:41 AM CDT 

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE:  Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry 

  

Here is the reply I got from research   

  

MP 

  

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, May 12, 2025 6:51 AM 

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry 

  

Mary, 

Please see question from Jillian  

Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage)" <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

Date: May 9, 2025 at 4:27:26 PM CDT 

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry 

Reply-To: Public Works Garbage <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

  

Is there any update on this? 

 

                                                                                                      C onversati on ID:  d1fb1e81- 221e-11f0-a01c- 7a8463f376fd 669c2ece-2d1c-11f0-9449-3ba8894a3124 03c10c1On Fri, May 2 at 8:14, Consortium wrote: 
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Please see WM update  

Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com> 

Date: May 2, 2025 at 7:13:04 AM CDT 

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE:  Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment 

Inquiry 

  

I sent this to research – but in the meantime – she should have her bank put a trace on the 

payment also. 

  

Thanks 

MP 

  

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, May 1, 2025 6:48 PM 

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment 

Inquiry 

  

FYI 

Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage)" <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

Date: May 1, 2025 at 2:13:49 PM CDT 

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment 

Inquiry 

Reply-To: Public Works Garbage <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
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<s3-e04d8717-1ccc-47ad-80f0-7ace4be1f295-image001.png> 

  

 

                                                                                                      C onversati on ID:  d1fb1e81- 221e-11f0-a01c- 7a8463f376fd 691623b6-26c0- 11f0- 9015-b97f405d0fc9 03c10c1On Thu, May 1 at 12:57, Consortium wrote: 

Please see WM update  

Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com> 

Date: May 1, 2025 at 7:12:22 AM CDT 

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE:  Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment 

Inquiry 

  

I don’t see anything   

  

MP  

  

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, May 1, 2025 4:25 AM 

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - 

Assessment Inquiry 

  

  

Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: "Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage)" <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

Date: April 30, 2025 at 2:55:58 PM CDT 

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - 

Assessment Inquiry 

Reply-To: Public Works Garbage <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

  

She figured out how to do a screen shot. Here it is 

 

                                                                                                      C onversati on ID:  d1fb1e81- 221e-11f0-a01c- 7a8463f376fd 21e57935-25fd-11f0-abc4- e9db4ecc39d5 03c10c1On Wed, April 30 at 14:30, City of Saint Paul garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

wrote: 

She did a direct pay through the bank account 

WM Payment number that shows up on the bank statement - 250116215149122371 

  

She is able to view the payment on her bank account online, but is not great at using 

computers and isn't sure how to attach a pdf or do a screenshot, so I do not have a 

copy/proof to send you 

 

On Fri, April 25 at 19:40, Consortium wrote: 

Please see WM update  

Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com> 

Date: April 25, 2025 at 6:15:18 PM CDT 

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE:  Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - 

Assessment Inquiry 

  

What is the check # or money order # she used ? 

 

mp   
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From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, April 25, 2025 6:00 PM 

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - 

Assessment Inquiry 

  

Mary, 

Please see the information and request from Jillian  

Sent from my iPhone 

 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage)" <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

Date: April 25, 2025 at 4:47:02 PM CDT 

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 

Subject: 1076 Cumberland St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment 

Inquiry 

Reply-To: Public Works Garbage <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 

  

Hello, 

  

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 1076 Cumberland St. Please forward 

to Waste Management for their input.  

  

Ticket ID#: 1086436 

Ticket Requester: Jeanette Wilson 

Ticket Requester Email: (if available) 

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16514892579 

Property ID #: 252923210023 

Property Address: 1076 Cumberland St 

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 1 (January - March) 
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Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2025 

Pending Assessment Amount: $72.66 

Hauler: Waste Management 

Ticket Comments:  

  

PO says the payment posted to bank account Jan 16, for $63.20 

  

Please provide the following information: 

 Name and mailing address on the account 

 Itemized breakdown of invoice 

 Payment history 

 Contact with property owner 

Thank you, 

  

Jillian 

--- 

City of Saint Paul 

Public Works - Garbage 

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

stpaul.gov/garbage 

                                                                                                      C onversati on ID:  d1fb1e81- 221e-11f0-a01c- 7a8463f376fd d1fb1e81- 221e-11f0-a01c- 7a8463f376fd 03c10c1  

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.  
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