Lydia Campbell

From: Lydia (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 9, 2024 9:41 PM

To: Lydia Campbell

Subject: Re: FW: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 759 Maryland Ave E - Q3 2023 Assessment Inquiry - Waste
Management

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

fwd

On Sun, December 17 at 19:12, Lydia Campbell wrote:
fwd

On Thu, November 30 at 17:34, Consortium wrote:

Please see WM update.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Thursday, November 30, 2023 5:07 PM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 759 Maryland Ave E - Q3 2023 Assessment Inquiry - Waste Management

So | understand — we have to remove $119.89 off of our holding account for Patrick Maykoski — because we had
the wrong parcel number on Vineel’'s account - even thou Mr. Maykoski never pays his bill to WM and all
balances have been going to the city/county for certification?



MP

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 29, 2023 6:17 AM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: FW: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 759 Maryland Ave E - Q3 2023 Assessment Inquiry - Waste Management

Mary,

Please see response from Sarah.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Sarah (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 28, 2023 6:18 PM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>; Lydia Campbell <lydia.campbell@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: Re: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 759 Maryland Ave E - Q3 2023 Assessment Inquiry - Waste Management

Thank you. We can no longer apply the assessment to the other address so will be removing this one from the
resident account and next hauler payment.



Sarah Haas

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage

On Wed, November 22 at 11:53, Consortium wrote:

Please see WM update.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2023 11:38 AM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] FW: 759 Maryland Ave E - Q3 2023 Assessment Inquiry - Waste Management

| was waiting for a response from customer service.

For some reason a neighbor to Vineel has the same parcel number on his account as we do for Vineel.

So the balance belongs to Patrick Maykoski 758 Maryland Ave E - Parcel number 292922110022( | updated his
account with this one).

We mail out the past due letters based on the mailing address and not the parcel number - so Patrick Maykoski
would have gotten the letters that we mailed out ( | double checked the letter file).



Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2023 10:29 AM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 759 Maryland Ave E - Q3 2023 Assessment Inquiry - Waste Management

Mary,

Please see request from Lydia.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Lydia (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2023 10:24 AM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: 759 Maryland Ave E - Q3 2023 Assessment Inquiry - Waste Management

Please reply to this message. Thank you

On Tue, November 14 at 14:37, Lydia Campbell wrote:

Hello,



We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 759 Maryland Ave E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55106. Please forward to
Waste Management for their input.

Ticket ID#: 257335

Ticket Requester: Vineel Valapureddy

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16512336934
Property ID #: 202922440144

Property Address: 759 Maryland Ave E, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55106
Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Q3

Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2023

Pending Assessment Amount: $119.89

Hauler: Waste Management

Ticket Comments:

PO states that they paid this on time, but were assessed anyway. Address is on the delinquent list you sent, but
no NNP document copy included. | believe PO has 2 medium carts. See attached for proof of payment made
7/25/2023

Please also provide the following information:

« Name and mailing address on the account
e Itemized breakdown of invoice

e Payment history

e Contact with property owner

Thank you,



Lydia Campbell

City of Saint Paul
Department of Public Works - Garbage

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us

stpaul.gov/garbage

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



