Mai Vang

From: Lynn Rolf

Sent: Tuesday, January 20, 2026 2:48 PM

To: Mai Vang

Subject: RE: 1069 Case Ave, VB2601A - 28-29-22-13-0093

Paid by Watermark Title Agency on 12/16/2025.

From: Mai Vang <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Tuesday, January 20, 2026 2:46 PM

To: Lynn Rolf <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: 1069 Case Ave, VB2601A - 28-29-22-13-0093

Hi Lynn,
| am entering a TA for above property for 1/27 and noticed it’s no longer on the assessment page. Did he
pay the assessment?

Mai Vang

(She, her)
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