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#155519 900 Westminster St - Q2 2023 Assessment Removal

Submitted
August 28, 2023 at 13:39  

Received via
Mail  

Requester
Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Status category
On-hold  

Ticket status
On-hold  

Priority
Normal  

Group
PW - Garbage  

Assignee
Clare Pillsbury  

Ticket status
On-hold

Property ID Number
292922320127  

Do you need an interpreter?
No  

Latitude/Longitude
-93.08523,44.96838  

Project No.
230111  

Location
900 Westminster St, St. Paul, Minnesota, 55130  

Other Name
Kimberly Herrgott

Garbage Hauler
Waste Management  

Have you contacted your hauler about this garbage bill before?
Yes

Staff Comments
Hauler requested that the assessment be reduced to $62.44. This is due to the fact that the previous property owner's account was not cancelled when the new
owner signed for service as of 5/14/2023. The assessment should be reduced to reflect the time that the former property owner used garbage service, which was
from 4/1/2023 - 5/13/2023.

Billing year for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment
2023  

Date of CP (MM/DD/YYYY)
11/15/2023  

Total amount due for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment
133.87

Legislative Hearing Required
Yes  

Date of LH (MM/DD/YYYY)
10/5/2023

Stated Reason for Appeal (if given)
The previous owner’s account and wasn’t canceled when the new owner signed up for service as of 5.14.23
Did you receive a Saint Paul City Council Public Hearing Notice Ratification of Assessment?
Yes  

Garbage Invoice Dates (i.e. January 1- March 31)
April 1 - June 30

Billing period for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment
Quarter 2 (April - June)  

Time of LH
9:00 AM

Sarah Haas August 28, 2023 at 13:39

 

Clare will take care of this when she’s back next week

 

Sarah Haas 
Garbage Program Manager
She/Her/Hers
Public Works
25 4th St. West, Floor 800

Saint Paul, MN 55102
P:651-266-6216
sarah.haas@stpaul.gov
www.StPaul.gov 

 

 

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, August 11, 2023 4:36 PM
To: Sarah Haas <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Clare Pillsbury <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Fwd: 900 Westminster St St Paul Parcel #292922320127

 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.
 

Sarah,

Please see the information and request from Mary.

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com>
Date: August 11, 2023 at 4:18:31 PM CDT
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com
Subject: 900 Westminster St  St Paul  Parcel #292922320127
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Internal note

Internal note

Please take off $71.43 of the $133.87 that we sent to the city/county for certification – 2nd Qtr 2023.

This is the previous owner’s account and it wasn’t canceled when the new owner signed up for service as of 5.14.23.

The balance for certification should now be $62.44 – for service from 4.1.23 to 5.13.23 – 96 gal trash service, taxes and 1 ½ finance charges of $8.73

 

Thanks

 

Mary Patch

Sales Coordinator

Public Sector

mpatch@wm.com

 

1901 Ames Dr

Burnsville,  MN 55306

 

Access WM 24/7 with MyWM

 

 

  

 

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.

Clare Pillsbury August 28, 2023 at 13:39

Forwarding this to create a Zendesk ticket. Feel free to just assign to me if you get this first.

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant I - Citywide Garbage Program

Pronouns: she/her/hers

Department of Public Works

800 City Hall Annex

25 West Fourth St

Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.StPaul.gov
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Clare Pillsbury August 28, 2023 at 13:59

Need to create legislative hearing.
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