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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: nkaujxwb fang <nfangxiong@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 3:49 PM
To: Assessments (CI-StPaul)
Subject: Re: File # J2104A ; Assessment # 218503

Best phone number is 651-239-7060. Thanks.   
 
 
Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Monday, December 28, 2020, 3:43 PM, Assessments (CI-StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote: 

Ok, I will put together a file and will set this for hearing on January 5, 2021 via telephone between 10 
and 11:30 a.m.  Please respond with the best number to call you for the hearing.   Once I am done 
putting the file together, I will send you the documents again and videos of what the City crew did.  I can 
interpret for you, unless you want someone else which we will call Language Line via telephone as well.    

  

  

  

 

Mai Vang 
Legislative Hearing Coordinator 
Saint Paul City Council 
15 W Kellogg Bvd, Ste. 310 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651-266-8563 

O: 651-266-8585 

F: 651-266-8574 

mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

   Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 
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From: nkaujxwb fang <nfangxiong@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 3:22 PM 
To: Assessments (CI-StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Re: File # J2104A ; Assessment # 218503 

  

Yes I would like to appeal this because I never received the warning notice in the mail so I had no way to 
know I only had 4 days to throw it away. I was waiting for my son to help me.    

The city guy never told me I only had 4 days when I talked to him. I only received his business card.   
That is not fair.  I understand moving it from the blvd to my property is not getting rid of it but we were 
going to go throw it away over the weekend.   

If we knew we had a deadline we would have done it already.   

Are you able to have a Hmong interpreter? 

  

  

Thanks! 

 
 
Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Monday, December 28, 2020, 2:04 PM, Assessments (CI-StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
wrote: 

Moving from one location to another is not getting rid of the item.    Do you want 
to appeal? 

  

From: nkaujxwb fang <nfangxiong@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 1:10 PM 
To: Assessments (CI-StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Re: File # J2104A ; Assessment # 218503 

  

Hi!  Yes, I did meet and spoke with the city guy who walked around.  I told him I 
will move it and I did move it back to my property that same day.   

I moved it off the blvd back to my property to bring it to be disposed.  So why am 
I being billed?   

  

Thanks! 
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Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Monday, December 28, 2020, 12:34 PM, Assessments (CI-StPaul) 
<Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote: 

Yes the letter I attached is the warning.  (resend). 

  

Below is what the inspector wrote: 

  

Assigned 
To: 

Suon, Stephan Phone:  

  07/10/2020: *Compliance Recheck - I INSPECTED THE PROPERTY FOR GARBAGE TODAY AND 
FOUND THE FOLLOWING: REFRIGERATOR ON THE BOULEVARD. I TOOK PHOTOS AND 
ENTERED THEM IN THE APP. I TAPED THE FREEZER LID SHUT. AN OCCUPANT WAS 
ON SCENE WHEN I ARRIVED. I ADVISED HIM ABOUT THE REFRIGERATOR AND GAVE 
HIM A BUSINESS CARD. HE SAID HE WILL REMOVE IT. SENDING FOUR DAYS 
SUMMARY ABATEMENT ORDER. 

      Main Photo for SA Letter|0 (2883262) 

DSI Code Enforcement Reinspection: 

Assigned 
To: 

Suon, Stephan Phone:  

  07/15/2020: Close - I REINSPECTED THE PROPERTY FOR GARBAGE TODAY AND FOUND THE 
FOLLOWING REMAINING: REFRIGERATOR ON THE BOULEVARD BUT WAS MOVED IN 
FRONT OF THE GARAGE. I TOOK PHOTOS AND ENTERED THEM IN THE APP. THE 
PO/RESPONSIBLE PARTY NEVER MADE ANY ATTEMPT TO CONTACT ME. PHOTOS 
ENTERED IN THE APP AND WORK ORDER SENT. 

      Main Photo for SA Letter|0 (2886199) 

  

  

Mai  

  

From: nkaujxwb fang <nfangxiong@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 12:27 PM 
To: Assessments (CI-StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Re: File # J2104A ; Assessment # 218503 

  

Was a warning notice sent to us prior to it being picked up?   
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Thanks! 
 
 
Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Monday, December 28, 2020, 12:24 PM, Assessments (CI-
StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote: 

It’s about a refrigerator on the blvd that the City 
cleaned out on July 16, 2020.  Do you want to 
contest this fee?  If so, I can put the record together 
and send you the file for the hearing. 

  

  

  

 

Mai Vang 
Legislative Hearing Coordinator 
Saint Paul City Council 
15 W Kellogg Bvd, Ste. 310 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651-266-8563 

O: 651-266-8585 

F: 651-266-8574 

mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

   Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 

  

  

  

  

  

From: nkaujxwb fang <nfangxiong@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 12:19 PM 
To: Assessments (CI-StPaul) 
<Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Re: File # J2104A ; Assessment # 218503 

  

1030 4th street East 
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Saint Paul 

  

  

Thanks 
 
 
Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Monday, December 28, 2020, 12:17 PM, 
Assessments (CI-StPaul) 
<Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote: 

What is the property address you 
are referencing? 

  

  

  

 

Mai Vang 
Legislative Hearing Coordinator 
Saint Paul City Council 
15 W Kellogg Bvd, Ste. 310 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651-266-8563 

O: 651-266-8585 

F: 651-266-8574 

mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

   Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in 
America 

  

  

  

  

  

From: nkaujxwb fang 
<nfangxiong@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 
11:28 AM 
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To: Assessments (CI-StPaul) 
<Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: File # J2104A ; 
Assessment # 218503 

  

Hello,   

  

I received a Ratification of 
Assessment for $452 in the Mail.  

Can you please clarify what this is 
for?   

  

File J2104A 

Assessment 218503 

  

Thank you! 
 
 
Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 


