Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2021 3:10 PM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: Voice Mail (1 minute)

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Mai,

If you don’t mind calling him that would be great. He may have other questions regarding the process.

Thank you,
Lynn

Lynn M. Rolf
Assessments Supervisor
Office of Financial Services - Assessments

700 City Hall
SAINT PAUL 15 West Kellogg Boulevard
MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8851
lynn.rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov/assessments

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2021 2:45 PM

To: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Voice Mail (1 minute)

Let me know if | need to call him

Mai Vang

City Council Offices - Legislative Hearings

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals - www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA




From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2021 1:13 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Voice Mail (1 minute)

Mai,

Would you listen to this message? The property owner indicated that Ramsey County changed the owner name in error,
which seems consistent in our system. He received the invoice but not the notice. Is this one that could come back to
Legislative Hearing given the County’s error?

It is assessment no. 218514 Property Clean-Up that was ratified on June 2.
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Please let me know how we should proceed.

Thank you,

Lynn
Lynn M. Rolf

* Assessments Supervisor
Office of Financial Services - Assessments
700 City Hall
SAINT PAUL 15 West Kellogg Boulevard
MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8851
lynn.rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov/assessments

From: 6512452990 <+16512452990>

Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2021 1:05 PM

To: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Voice Mail (1 minute)

You received a voice mail from 6512452990.



Set Up Voice Mail



