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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Hoffman, James (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 1:04 PM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Sheffer, Vicki (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 298 Jenks Avenue - VB fee

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

The file was closed on 12-29-2020,  I am fine with issuing a refund for 2021 vb fees 
 

  

James Hoffman, CBO-L 
DSI INSPECTOR II- Vacant Buildings  
Department of Safety and Inspections 
(651)266-1947 
375 Jackson St.   
Saint Paul, MN 55101 
James.hoffman@ci.stpaul.mn.us       
  www.StPaul.gov                                                                                                                   

 
 

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 1:02 PM 
To: Hoffman, James (CI-StPaul) <james.hoffman@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 298 Jenks Avenue - VB fee 
 
Hi James, 
Previous owner, Garret Plumley, called and stated that current owner presented an invoice of the VB fee to 
him.  He indicated  you had closed the file and the VB fee should have been deleted.  Please confirm so I can do a 
resolution to delete and a refund will need to be processed.   
 
Closing date was 12/4/20.   
 
https://legacyapps.stpaul.city/STAMPProperty/ProjectViewer?devDatabase=n&folderRSN=4783761&folderType=V
B&txtCallFrom=summary&userID=Intranet 
 
 
 
Mai Vang 
City Council Offices – Legislative Hearings 
15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563 
Legislative Hearing Appeals – www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings 
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