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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Peterson, Janis (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 12:26 PM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: Solo Vino Graffiti - 517 Selby
Attachments: graf.pdf

Chuck Kanski called to schedule his Legislative Hearing for 7-7 at 10:00 a.m. for 517 Selby (J2007P).  He was very angry 
because Rita nor Kristina ever got back to him.  He wanted to complain to someone higher up because he was frustrated 
(see his note below with photo).  I told him he needs to talk to the Legislative Hearing Officer and the Inspectors at his 
Legislative Hearing for any of his future complaints.   Here is his contact information: 
 
Chuck Kanski 
chuck@solovinowines.com 
651-249-4039 
 
Janis 
 

From: Chuck Kanski <chuck@solovinowines.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2020 11:47 AM 
To: Peterson, Janis (CI-StPaul) <janis.peterson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Fwd: Solo Vino Graffiti 
 
Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Hi Janis ~  
Please review the info below as well as the pictures.  
THANKS 
Peace, Chuck 
 
 

Begin forwarded message: 
 
From: Chuck Kanski <chuck@solovinowines.com> 
Subject: Solo Vino Graffiti 
Date: March 6, 2020 at 2:10:27 PM CST 
To: Rita.Aguirre@ci.stpaul.mn.us 
Cc: Kristina Schweinler <Kristina.Schweinler@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
 
Hi Rita ~ 
So we took care of the graffiti on our building wall. The graffitti was under the Revival sign and 
surrounded the handicap sign. I took care of this on Monday. 
Someone from the city came out and covered the building spot to the right with a horrible yellow. I 
started to cover the yellow up and ran out of paint. I now have to buy more paint. Can the city 
reimburse me for this paint since someone from the city came out and marked up the building? The 
graffiti was all ready taken care of and I have no idea why they would have painted the building. 
Please let me know what to do. 
Peace, Chuck 
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