Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2020 3:27 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: Qtr 3 2020

Attachments: Estate of Robert Leon Thompson, Sr. (Court File No. 62-PR-19-910).eml
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Can you get this Q3 2020 assessment removal entered into legistar? Residents father passed away in 2019 and the
house has been vacant since that time. He was unaware he had to do anything and the bills seem to be going to a trust.

Chris

From: andre thompson <marquisdre@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2020 1:23 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Qtr 3 2020

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Christopher thanks for taking some time out of your day to discuss this garbage bill for 397 Thomas ave. So moving
forward we would like to dispute these charges and request a refund. This information should be sent to the following
address Andre Thompson 180 KelloggBlvd Apt 614 St.Paul Mn 55101.

Any refunds should be in the attention of The Estate of Robert Leon Thompson.

Thanks and have a great Holiday!

Regards
Andre



