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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:39 PM
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: FW: 852 FREMONT AVE Q3 2020 Assessment Inquiry

Great. Thank you Mary! 
 
 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works  
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
Saint Paul City Hall Annex 
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.  
Saint Paul, MN 55102  
P: 612-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

 

   
   
 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:38 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: FW: 852 FREMONT AVE Q3 2020 Assessment Inquiry 
 
Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Clare, 
Please see update from Mary. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>  
Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 2:36 PM 
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To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: 852 FREMONT AVE Q3 2020 Assessment Inquiry 
 
The only contact we have had with this resident is when Mrs. called on 12.21.20 to set up a bulk pick up – nothing noted 
about missing payments. 
Also since we got this account from Berquist in 2019 we have never received a payment from them.  
Every balance has been sent to the city for certification.  
 
8534918 04/05/20 MISC TAX     INV  T1A         6.59                       6.59  
8534918 04/05/20 MISC TAX     INV  T1I        18.92                      25.51  
8534918 04/05/20              INV  06A        67.56                      93.07  
8534918 04/27/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                      97.72  
8534918 05/27/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                     102.37  
8534918 06/26/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                     107.02  
8534918 07/06/20 ST PAUL BAL  PMT  MSC                    107.02           .00  
8606720 07/06/20 MISC TAX     INV  T1A         6.59                       6.59 
8606720 07/06/20 MISC TAX     INV  T1I        18.92                      25.51  
8606720 07/06/20              INV  06A        67.56                      93.07  
8606720 07/27/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                      97.72  
8606720 08/26/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                     102.37  
8606720 09/29/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                     107.02  
8606720 10/05/20 ST PAUL BAL  PMT  MSC                    107.02           .00  
8682657 10/05/20 MISC TAX     INV  T1A         6.59                       6.59  
8682657 10/05/20 MISC TAX     INV  T1I        18.92                      25.51  
8682657 10/05/20              INV  06A        67.56                      93.07  
8682657 10/27/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                      97.72  
8682657 11/30/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                     102.37  
8682657 12/30/20 FIN CHRG     FIN  LPR         4.65                     107.02 
8682657 01/05/21 ST PAUL BAL  PMT  MSC                    107.02           .00 
 
Mary Patch   
 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 6, 2021 5:20 PM 
To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 852 FREMONT AVE Q3 2020 Assessment Inquiry 
 
Mary, 
Please see information and request below. 
 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
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From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 6, 2021 5:19 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 852 FREMONT AVE Q3 2020 Assessment Inquiry 
 
Please forward to: Waste Management 
  
Property Address & PID: 852 FREMONT AVE & 332922230186 
Property Owner:   ZOLTAN PUSENYAK 
Phone Number or Email: 651-285-1907 or Unknown 
Pending Assessment Amount: $107.02 
Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Q3 2020 
  
Summary of Issue:  
Property owner states that they made a payment of $110.48 to the City of Saint Paul on 11/12/2020. They believe that 
this is for the Q3 2020 assessments. Please provide the following information for Q2 2020 – Q4 2020:  
 

- Invoice and payment history 
- Contact with the property owner 

 
Thank you! 
 
 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works  
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
Saint Paul City Hall Annex 
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.  
Saint Paul, MN 55102  
P: 612-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

 

   
   
 
 
 

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.  


