Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 4:22 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: FW: 724 Virginia Q4 2020 Assessment Inquiry

Just an FYI that | will be deleting the Q3 and Q4 2020 assessments as a courtesy from the city payments. The Q2 2020
assessment was already levied to the property taxes.

Clare Pillsbury
Management Assistant |
Saint Paul Public Works
Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall Annex

SAINT PAUL 15W.Kellogg Blvd.

MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 651-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 4:18 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: FW: 724 Virginia Q4 2020 Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Clare,
Please see update from Mary.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.
grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054



From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 4:15 PM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: FW: 724 Virginia Q4 2020 Assessment Inquiry

| have the account in the name of Manuel G Nava - you didn’t give me the son’s last name so | just want to make sure.
There is the name of Mercides T Nava on the account —is that his mother ?

| have this note on the account from Feb 2020

02/10/2020 08:10:34 LJACKS23

MANUEL SON CI TO ADVISE THAT HE IS DECEASED; WANTED TO CANCEL ACCOUNT. A
DVISED STEVEN (SON) THAT WE ARE NOT ABLE TO CANCEL BUT WE CAN DO VACA HO
LD. SENT FORM TO EMAIL ADDRESS

Then nothing again until here

02/01/2021 10:12:12 LDANIEL3

STEVEN CI TO REQUEST CANCELATION DUE TO FATHER PASSED DEC 2019 PER SUP H
AVE SON CALL CITY TO APPLY FOR VACANCY

| am not canceling this account all the way back to Dec 2019 - he had ample opportunity to contact us in the past year.

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 3:34 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 724 Virginia Q4 2020 Assessment Inquiry

Mary,
Please see information and request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 3:33 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 724 Virginia Q4 2020 Assessment Inquiry

Please forward to: Waste Management

Property Address & PID: 724 Virginia & 252923430079
Property Owner: Steven (Son of deceased P/Q's)
Phone Number or Email: 952-937-4905 or N/A
Pending Assessment Amount: $107.02



Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Q3 2020

Summary of Issue:
Property Owner's son stated that he submitted a hold to WM around Jan 2020. Please confirm whether Waste
Management received the service hold and provide the following information for Q1 2020 - Q3 2020:

- Service holds applied to property
- Invoice and Payment history
- Contact with property owner

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury
Management Assistant |
Saint Paul Public Works
Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall Annex

SAINT PAUL 15W.Kellogg Blvd.

MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 651-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



