Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, January 15, 2021 4:12 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: Q4 2018 - Q2 2019 Delinquent Garbage Assessments for 2245 CARVER AVENUE

Please add to LH file for 2245 Carver Ave. The hearing has been laid over to 01/21/2021.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury
* Management Assistant |
Saint Paul Public Works
Pronouns: she/her/hers

Saint Paul City Hall Annex

SAINT PAUL 15W.Kellogg Bivd.

MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 612-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.sov

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, January 14, 2021 2:17 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Q4 2018 - Q2 2019 Delinquent Garbage Assessments for 2245 CARVER AVENUE

Oct to Dec 2018 $102.44 — Certified to 2020 Taxes $ 104.94
Jan to March 2019 $102.44 — Certified to 2020 Taxes $ 104.94
April to June 2019 $102.44 — Certified to 2020 Taxes $ 104.94
July to Sept 2019 $141.55- Certified to 2020 Taxes $ 144.05
All above have been certified to the 2020 Taxes.

Oct to Dec 2019 $116.73 — Certified to 2021 Taxes $ 119.23
Jan to March 2020 $114.34 — Certified to 2020 Taxes $ 116.84
April to June 2020 $114.34 — Certified to 2020 Taxes $ 116.84
All above have been certified to the 2021 Taxes.

July to Sept 2020 amt still owing S 114.34.
Above is payable to the Assessment Office.



Tanya ) Panzer

Office of Financial Services - Assessments

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 700 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8858 | D: (651) 266-6153

Assessment Look Up- www.stpaul.gov/assessments

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, January 14, 2021 2:03 PM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Q4 2018 - Q2 2019 Delinquent Garbage Assessments for 2245 CARVER AVENUE

Hello Lynn and Tanya,

Could you send me a list of any Delinquent Garbage Assessments for 2245 Carver Avenue from Q4 2018 — Q2 20197 Also
please let us know if any of them were sent to Ramsey County for Certification.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury
'*. Management Assistant |
Saint Paul Public Works
Pronouns: she/her/hers

Saint Paul City Hall Annex

SAINT PAUL 15W.Kellogg Blvd.

MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 612-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov




