Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Hailey Hill <hillx716@d.umn.edu>

Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 2:01 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: Re: FW: 1663 Seventh St E -Date changed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Hello Mai,
No need to appeal anymore! Thank you.

On Thu, Jan 28, 2021 at 1:58 PM Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Ms. Hill,

Here attached is the receipt that was paid in full. Let me know if you still want to appeal.

Mai

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 1:50 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: RE: 1663 Seventh St E -Date changed

There is need for her to go to a hearing here is the receipt show the items were paid in full.

All pending assessments will get notice even if the item is PAID.

Tanya ) Panzer

Office of Financial Services - Assessments



15 W Kellogg Blvd, 700 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8858 | D: (651) 266-6153

Assessment Look Up- www.stpaul.gov/assessments

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 1:32 PM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 1663 Seventh St E -Date changed

Tanya,

Can you check on this? Thanks!

Mai

From: Hailey Hill <hillx716@d.umn.edu>

Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 11:55 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: 1663 Seventh St E -Date changed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

| will still go through with the hearing. | would like to make sure it is paid. Thank you Mai!

On Thu, Jan 28, 2021 at 11:48 AM Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:
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Oh, if the assessment was paid, then we don’t need a hearing unless you want to.

From: Hailey Hill <hillx716@d.umn.edu>

Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 11:47 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: 1663 Seventh St E -Date changed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

But the assessment was paid.

On Thu, Jan 28, 2021 at 11:42 AM Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Ms. Hill,

We are done with hearing. We will keep the Feb 2™ as scheduled. Thank you!

I Mai Vang

ARAA Legislative Hearing Coordinator
Pronouns: she/her/hers

SAINT PAUL Saint Paul City Hall, Ste. 310

MINNESOTA
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.

Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 612-266-8515

mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.StPaul.gov

i% Please consider the environment before printing this ermail



From: Hailey Hill <hillx716@d.umn.edu>

Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 11:41 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: 1663 Seventh St E -Date changed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Hello Mai,

| apologize | just saw this email. | am available over the phone as soon as possible, my phone number is 763-438-
5535. However, regarding this assessment | did speak with my title company last week and they had said this
assessment has been paid in full in October 2020 by the sellers of my property. | am unsure if there is a
miscommunication, but please call me when you’re able to. Thank you!

-Hailey Hill

On Tue, Jan 26, 2021 at 8:16 PM Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Hello Ms. Hill,

Your appeal is scheduled for 2/2/21 @ 10 a.m. However, due to the volume of appeals we have on 2/2/21, | was
wondering if | can move your appeal to this Thursday, January 28, 2021 via telephone between 10:30 a.m. and
noon. If so, please confirm as soon as you can. Thank you and sorry for the inconvenience.



Mai Vang

ARAR Legislative Hearing Coordinator
Pronouns: she/her/hers

SAINT PAUL  saint Paul City Hall, Ste. 310
MINNESOTA
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.

Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 612-266-8515

mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.StPaul.gov
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