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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Kenneth Schmidt <kennethschmidt1982@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, January 22, 2021 12:51 PM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: Re: 1155 Margaret St - videos

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
And that ramp the ramp is temporarily there because my dog had surgery and cannot go up and down stairs at this time 
 
On Fri, Jan 22, 2021, 12:48 PM Kenneth Schmidt <kennethschmidt1982@gmail.com> wrote: 
Okay so I could not get the before video to play but I know what it looked like before then I noticed he didn't take any 
kind of video of all the Landscaping I did on the other side of the garage right there and everything around the whole 
house was cut down there was a huge pile of brush there was a big Crate Box there everything is been picked up all he 
did was take that bored you can see on the camera in front of my garage and some plastic piece that was on the side I 
seen they have even against the garbage can that I don't even know what that came from or whose it is so how am I 
going to get charged $450 when the only thing he did was take that whiteboard that's in front of the garage everything 
else was cleaned up beside the wheelbarrow was still outside from us moving stuff around and working cleaning it all 
up please explain to me how I can get charge $450 for him taking my board? You guys gave me the piece of paper with 
the deadline to clean it up by and me and my girlfriend spent over two days cleaning everything up so it was perfect so 
this wouldn't happen so why am I being charged still it was done by the deadline 
 
On Fri, Jan 22, 2021, 12:26 PM Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <Mai.Vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote: 

The following attachments have been sent to you using Mail Express®:  

1155MargaretSt_20-069096_8-31-20_After.MOV (20.6 MB) 
1155MargaretSt_20-069096_8-31-20_Before.MOV (61.7 MB) 

Click the links above or visit the pick-up portal for batch retrieval or to reply with your own attachments.  
These links will expire in 14 days.  

See attached per my email. 

 

Mai Vang 

651-266-8563 


