Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Wednesday, December 30, 2020 1:27 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: Resolution to Abate Q1 2019 - Q2 2020 Assessments
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

It's a request from us (Solid Waste Program).

Just a note: We actually only need the Q1 2019 assessment reduced to from $288.24 to $192.16, which is the price of
two 64-gal carts.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury
A Management Assistant |
Saint Paul Public Works

Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall Annex

SAINT PAUL 15W.Kellogg Bivd.

MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 612-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Wednesday, December 30, 2020 12:45 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Resolution to Abate Q1 2019 - Q2 2020 Assessments

Is this a request from the property owner to remove? Or is it from the dept? Since it’s been levied, we would have to
ask the County to abate from the 2020 or 2021 Property Tax Statement

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Wednesday, December 30, 2020 10:18 AM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>




Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Resolution to Abate Q1 2019 - Q2 2020 Assessments

Hello Mai,

We need a resolution to abate for Q1 2019, Q2 2019, Q3 2019, Q4 2019, Q1 2020, and Q2 2020 delinquent garbage
assessments for 749 Sims Ave.

It appears as through there was an vacancy request that should have gone into effect on January 1, 2019 for one of the
three residential dwelling units at the property. Due to the assessed amounts being for a single 64-gal cart with late fees,
staff recommends removing each assessment in full. Is this possible for the assessments that were levied last year (Q1 &
Q2 2019)? Please let me know.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury
'*' Management Assistant |
Saint Paul Public Works

Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall Annex

SAINT PAUL 15W.Kellogg Blvd.

MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102
P: 612-266-8862

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov




