LaCasse, Jill (CI-StPaul)

From: Aspnes, Michael (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, December 3, 2020 3:17 PM
To: LaCasse, Jill (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Sampson, Steven (Cl-StPaul)
Subject: FW: Van Follow Up

Hey lill,

FYI, please see below for info regarding vans from DNR.

Best,
Mike

From: Bailey, Chris <cbailey@rochestermn.gov>

Sent: Thursday, December 3, 2020 3:16 PM

To: Aspnes, Michael (CI-StPaul) <michael.aspnes@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Sampson, Steven (CI-StPaul) <steven.sampson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Van Follow Up

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

2009 Ford F-350 15 passenger van
Military lists original acquisition price at $22,657.33

Items are through the DNR’s Federal Excess Property Program (FEPP).

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Aspnes, Michael (CI-StPaul) <michael.aspnes@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Wednesday, December 2, 2020 12:49:58 PM

To: Bailey, Chris <cbailey@rochestermn.gov>

Cc: Sampson, Steven (CI-StPaul) <steven.sampson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Van Follow Up

[EXTERNAL SENDER]: Do not open links/attachments if uncertain about the sender and never give out your user id and
password.

Chief,

Please see below for info I've been requested to obtain so that our city council can process the transaction.

1. Year, Make and models of the vans

2. Value of the vans



3. The entity that is donating the vans to our department

Please let me know if | can provide any additional info or if you have a contact | can call to get the info and avoid
creating any extra work for you. Sincere thanks again.

V/R,
Mike

Sent via the Samsung Galaxy S9, an AT&T 5G Evolution capable smartphone
Get Outlook for Android
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From: Bailey, Chris <cbailey@rochestermn.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, November 25, 2020 11:00 AM

To: Olson, Sean A. (Sean.Olsor li li

nn.gov) <Sean.Ol: minr go'

Ce: Pete Knaeble <PKnaeble@EdinaMN.gov>; 'Erickson, Mark' <merickson @southmetrofire.com>; Stephani
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Expires 5/31/2021

h i li: gov; Pete Fisher <pfisher@EdinaMN.gov>; Aspnes, Michael (Cl-StPaul) <michael.aspnes@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Jungels,

Kris <kjungels@rochestermn.gov>
Subject: FW: Vans

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Hi Sean,

4 Ford vans (15 passengers) were picked up from Sparta yesterday and are at the training center in Rochester. You are welcome to come down and pick the 2 that you would like for MFD. The remaining 2 vans will being offered first to any MNTF1
agency and then to any MN Fire Department. If you think you'd be interested in more than 2, that's fine also. 3 of the vans were driven back from Sparta as is. The 4" was trailered only because we were short a driver. All seem to be serviceable. All
units were manufactured in 2009. Mileages are 35K, 41K, 49K, and 51K. There is no cost associated with the vans. There is a simple form/process for obtaining the title(s). After 2 years you a free to do whatever you want with the vehicle (sell, scrap,
trade, etc.). If prior to the 2 years there is a reason you want to get rid of the vehicle (i.e. significant mechanical issue not worth fixing) there is a process, it just involves a bit of documentation. Please let me know what works for you coming to

Rochester and | will get it scheduled on our end.

Everyone else,

Please let me know if your agency has any interest In the remaining vans.
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