
From: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council
To: "pam jacobowski"
Subject: RE: File objection to assessment at 1295 Galtier st
Date: Tuesday, November 17, 2020 2:41:00 PM

Your payment should be postmarked today and sent to the address below.  It can also be paid online
today.  After today, it will be part of your 2021 tax bill.
 
City of Saint Paul Assessments
700 City Hall
15 Kellogg Boulevard West
Saint Paul, MN  55102
 
Racquel Naylor
City Council Offices
Suite 310 City Hall
15 Kellogg Boulevard West
Saint Paul, MN  55102
Phone: 651-266-8560
Fax:  651-266-8574
 
From: pam jacobowski <prjacobowski@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 10:23 PM
To: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: File objection to assessment at 1295 Galtier st

Hi. I was just received the letter in the mail today regarding the assessment#200025 for 1295
Galtier. I just bought this house on September 29. Since I didn't receive the letter regarding the
November 15th deadline until November 16th (today), I don't think it's fair for me to be charged
interest. Please let me know if I can just pay it now, and avoid any extra charges besides the $56.
 
Thank you,
 
Pamela Vazquez, 651-210-4222
 
1295 Galtier, st Paul, mn, 55117
Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android
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