From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul)

To: arrimsenterprise@gmail.com
Cc: *CI-StPaul Contact-Council
Subject: RE: ID Number: 25-29-23-41-0028 — Property: 924 WOODBRIDGE ST - OBJECTION
Date: Thursday, October 29, 2020 5:32:29 PM
Attachments: 924 Woodbridge Assessment Obiection.pdf
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Good Afternoon,

| would like to do some research for this payment because | don’t see a payment posted on the
account. Would you provide a copy (front and back) of the check so we can verify the parcel
number and who cashed the check?

The image can be sent directly to me.

Thank you,
Lynn

Lynn M. Rolf

Assessments Supervisor

Office of Financial Services/Real Estate

TO0 City Hall, 15 West Kellogg Boulevard

Saint Paul. MN 55102

P: 651-266-8851

F:651-266-8541

view assessments al www sipaul pov/assessments
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The Moat Livable

City Arnersta .

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America

From: Arrims Enterprise <arrimsenterprise@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 29, 2020 2:03 PM

To: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: RE: ID Number: 25-29-23-41-0028 — Property: 924 WOODBRIDGE ST - OBJECTION

You will find attached a written objection regarding the subject hereof.
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CITY OF SAINT PAUL

CITY CLERK
310 City Hall

15 W. Kellogg Blvd.
St. Paul, MN 55102-1668

Contact-Council

ci.stpaul.mn.us

ARRIMS ENTERPRISE
4939 Bongard Way
Inver Grove Heights [55076]

contact@arrims.com
(651)404-5694

We, the people of the state of Minnesota (by and
through the Subscriber herein named), with whom
——— the State of Minnesota, and it's agencies, are forever

obligated, hereby assert that the Person(s), Property
OFFICIAL BUSINESS and enjoyment of Arrims Enterprise is EXEMPT from
Levy, Article 4 § 2, US Const.

October 29, 2020

RE: 1D Number: 25-29-23-41-0028 — Property: 924 WOODBRIDGE ST - OBJECTION

To: City Clerk

Objection to assessment (#200025) is hereby asserted. Payment for 2020 Street Maintenance Service Program
fees for Lighting and Sweeping, via security, was made in the amount of $28.00, and received on September 3,
2020, via Certified Mail: 70190700000117093056.

If you have any questions regarding such method of payment, direct the same to the undersigned at the mailing

address below.

ARRIMS ENTERPRISE

By:
Mr. Tommie Perris’tfawford,
Authorized Representative

PO Box 40241
Saint Paul, Minnesota [55104]






Lynn M. Rolf
| Assessments Supervisor

Office of Financial Services/Real Estate
700 City Hall. 15 West Kellogg Boulevard
Saint Paul. MN 55102

P: 651-266-8851

LLLL | F:651-266-8541
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