From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul)

To: kasnidarich@gmail.com

Cc: *CI-StPaul Contact-Council

Subject: RE: Assessment

Date: Friday, October 30, 2020 11:32:32 AM
Attachments: 546 Fairview Ave S SSSC.pdf

546 Fairview Ave S SMSP.pdf

Sorry, here they are.

From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 11:32 AM

To: kasnidarich@gmail.com

Cc: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@eci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Assessment

Kelly,
Attached are copies of the invoices.

Thank you,
Lynn

From: Kelly Snidarich <kasnidarich@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 29, 2020 6:43 PM

To: *CI-StPaul _Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Assessment

Can another bill be sent so I can pay it before it becomes an assessment of my property taxes? Because I think the
previous bill came before we moved into the property.

-Kelly Snidarich
Sent from my iPhone

> On Oct 29, 2020, at 5:05 PM, *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:
>

> The present owner of the property is responsible for paying any pending assessments on the property.
>

> Have a good day.

>

> Racquel Naylor

> City Council Offices

> Suite 310 City Hall

> 15 Kellogg Boulevard West

> Saint Paul, MN 55102

> Phone: 651-266-8560

> Fax: 651-266-8574

> From: Kelly Snidarich <kasnidarich@gmail.com>


mailto:Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us
mailto:kasnidarich@gmail.com
mailto:Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us

City of Saint Paul
Storm Sewer System Charge

INVOICE

The Most Livable
City in America

This is your 2020 invoice for the Storm Sewer System Charge. This charge pays for the operation and maintenance of the
storm sewer system and funds programs to improve the quality of storm water runoff as required by the City's federal storm water
permit and local watershed districts.

c Property Address: 546 FAIRVIEW AVE S
Kelly Snidarich or Current Owner Property ID Number:  09-28-23-42-0037
Jacob Benson-Devine
546 Fairview Ave S Use Class: C
airview Ave Land Area: Less than 1/3 Acre
St Paul MN 55116-1466 AMOUNT DUE: $101.38

2020 Storm Sewer System Charge Rates

Use Class  Property Type Rate
A Cemeteries, golf courses, parks, unimproved vacant land, and ................. $169.57 per acre
one- and two-family residential land in excess of 1/3 acre

B Railroad 1and ........c.oooviiiiiii it $339.15 per acre
C Residential, one- and two-family homes (less than 1/3 acre) ...........cc......... $101.38 per parcel
D Condominiums and tOWN NOMES ..........ccceevieiiiiiiieie et $68.19 per unit

E Schools and cOMMUNILY CENLETS ......eevievrierieeiieeieeieeereesee e eveeveeveeseeeeenas $930.78 per acre
F Multiple dwellings, religious buildings, government buildings .................. $1,242.27 per acre
G Commercial and industrial land, parking lots ...........cccccceevveviencieeieeieennnn, $1,673.54 per acre

The Amount Due is a fixed amount per parcel or per unit, or is calculated by multiplying the rate-per-acre by the property
acreage (Land Area). Residential properties over 1/3 acre are charged the per parcel amount for the first 1/3 acre and the
per acre amount (Use Class A) for the land area over 1/3 acre.

How can I pay?

< 1) Pay by mail: Send the bottom of this invoice with your payment to the address below.
One check for both this invoice and the Street Maintenance Service Program is acceptable.

éL 2) Pay online at: stpaul.gov/assessments —
|

What will happen after November 15, 2020?
If you do not pay by November 15, 2020, the Amount Due plus a 3.25% interest charge will appear on your 2021 property
tax statement. Payment received after November 15th will be returned to the sender.

If you think your charge is incorrect, you may submit a written request for review to the Public Works Sewer Utility
Manager, 25 W. 4th Street, 7th floor, Saint Paul, MN 55102, within 30 days of this mailing. Explain why you think the
charge is incorrect.

Tenemos a su disposicion servicios de intérpretes

\ Call 651-266-8858 to ask about your bill. gratuitos 651-266-8858,

v Adeegyada tarjumaada oo lacag la’aan ah ayaad
Visit our link at stpaul.gov/assessments ‘NBR  |claysaa 651-266-8858,
to view assessment information. Yog koj xav tau tus neeg pab txhais lus dawb

651-266-8858.

o N0
=7 (Return this portion with your payment - DUE NOVEMBER 15, 2020) =7

Make check payable to: ~ City of Saint Paul

Mail to: City of Saint Paul - Assessments Property Address: 546 FAIRVIEW AVE S
C/O Lockbox Processing Property ID Number:  09-28-23-42-0037
PO Box 860646 Account Number: 200080
Minneapolis, MN 55486-0600 AMOUNT DUE: $ 101.38

(Please use the self-addressed envelope)
Returned checks are subject to a 330.00 fee

092423420037200060000001013482






Lighting

City of Saint Paul
Street Maintenance Service Program

and Sweeping

INVOICE

This is your 2020 invoice for the Street Maintenance Service Program. This fee pays for street lighting
maintenance, street sweeping, and alley sweeping for the period of August 1, 2019 through July 31, 2020.

Kelly Snidarich or Current Owner Property Address: 546 FAIRVIEW AVE S
; Z%OE Bel?sonfewsne Property ID Number:  09-28-23-42-0037
airview Ave
St Paul MN 55116-1466 AMOUNT DUE: $76.36
Fee Detail for this Property

Item Description Rate Frontage Amount
Citywide Street Lighting $0.59/foot X 46.00 feet = $27.14
Street Sweeping - Commercial/Arterial Street  $1.07/foot X 46.00 feet = $49.22

TOTAL $76.36

2020 Lighting and Sweeping Rates (per front foot of benefited property)

Item Description Rate
Street Sweeping - Downtown Streets $2.04
Street Sweeping - Outlying Commercial/Arterial Streets $1.07
Street Sweeping - Oiled/Paved Residential Streets $0.41
Alley Sweeping - Oiled/Paved Alleys $0.12
Citywide Street Lighting $0.59

Above-Standard Lighting Rates vary by lighting district

How can I pay?
>4 1y

dL 2) Pay online at: stpaul.gov/assessments

Pay by mail: Send the bottom of this invoice with your payment to the address below.
One check for both this invoice and the Street Maintenance Service Program is acceptable.

&)

E—
VISA

What will happen after September 30, 2020?

If you do not pay by September 30, 2020, the service fee will be processed as an assessment to your property. You may
pay the assessment until November 15th; after that date any unpaid Amount Due plus a 3.25% interest charge will
appear on your 2021 property tax statement. Payments received after November 15th will be returned to the sender.

X

Call 651-266-8858 to ask about your bill.

For questions about services, call:

Streets & alleys 651-266-9700

Visit our link at stpaul.gov/assessments 651-266-9777

to view assessment information.

Street lighting

For more information, visit:

¢ Tenemos a su disposicion servicios de intérpretes . .
P P stpaul.gov/StreetMaintenanceServiceProgram

gratuitos 651-266-8858

» Adeegyada tarjumaada oo lacag la’aan ah ayaad
helaysaa 651-266-8858

* Yog koj xav tau tus neeg pab txhais lus dawb
651-266-8858.

é

o o
=] . . . P20
(Return this portion with your payment - DUE SEPTEMBER 30, 2020)
Make check payable to: City of Saint Paul Property Address: 546 FAIRVIEW AVE S
Mail to: ~ City of Saint Paul Property ID Number:  09-28-23-42-0037
ggOBLocggg;‘ 4I6’rocessmg Project Number: 200025
ox AMOUNT DUE: $76.36

Minneapolis, MN 55486-0646
(Please use the self-addressed envelope)
Returned checks are subject to a $30.00 fee

092823420037200025000000763k3





Right of Way Invoice Reprint Summary

Print Date/Time: 10/30/2020 at 11:29:05AM

Project: 2020SMSP

Description: 2020 SMSP for street sweeping, alley sweeping, citywide street lighting and above-standard
street lighting.

Assessment: 200025

Interest Rate: 3.2500%

1 invoice(s) printed

0 exempt invoice(s)






> Sent: Thursday, October 29, 2020 12:52 PM

> To: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

> Subject: Assessment

>

> Hello,

> I live at 546 Fairview Ave S and received a notice about an assessment that’s due for $76.36 for street lighting and
sweeping. The day is states that the bill came out was during the time that we were moving in and I don’t recall
receiving the bill. We just purchased the house mid August so I’'m not quite sure who is responsible for paying the
bill. Any information on it would be greatly appreciated.

>

> Thank you,

> Kelly Snidarich

>

> Sent from my iPhone



