Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, November 2, 2020 8:42 AM
To: Vang, Mai (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 133 7th St E/312922430060
Attachments: VB Fees Sent to Assessment.6-3-19.xlsx

Tanya J Panzer

Assessment Technician

Office of Financial Services

15 W Kellogg Blvd, Suite 700

7" Floor City Hall, Saint Paul MN 55102

M: 651-266-8858 D: 651-266-6153 F: 651-266-8541
Assessment Look Up — www.stpaul.gov/assessments

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, November 2, 2020 8:42 AM

To: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 133 7th St E/312922430060

VB2001/208800 - Was assessed to the property in error and will be removed from the following property on Nov 18.
(This fee was sent to the assessment office on 6/3/2020 but DSI asked for it to be removed with a note will be sent to
assessments in June if not paid. | missed the removal part so | will put together a Resolution to remove from the
following property).

VB2002/208800 — This fee was sent to the assessment office on 7/1/2020 and Is assessed correctly for the fee was not
paid to DSI before June 2019. (Note: This fee covers the time period of 5/24/2019 to 5/24/2020. DSI does not prorate
the fee if the home becomes occupied during this time period. The owner would have had to attend a Legislative
Hearing to have it reduced or even deleted.

Thank

Tanya J Panzer

Assessment Technician

Office of Financial Services

15 W Kellogg Blvd, Suite 700

7" Floor City Hall, Saint Paul MN 55102

M: 651-266-8858 D: 651-266-6153 F: 651-266-8541
Assessment Look Up — www.stpaul.gov/assessments




