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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Joe Bauer <joe1976jmb@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, October 19, 2020 10:28 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: Re: Account Balance Inquiry [ ref:_00DE0IIt1._5004W1YNeRM:ref ]
Attachments: image002.png

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Should be coming through any minute now 
 
On Mon, Oct 19, 2020, 9:00 AM Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote: 

Thank you Joe. When you send the fax, please address it to “Attn: Clare Pillsbury.” That way it should get to me. Please 
send it by 12:00 PM today if you would like the records to be included in the Legislative Hearing. 

  

  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been mov ed, renamed,  
or deleted . Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

Clare Pillsbury 

Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651-266-8862 

F: 651-266-6222 
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From: Joe Bauer <joe1976jmb@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, October 16, 2020 4:08 PM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Fwd: Account Balance Inquiry [ ref:_00DE0IIt1._5004W1YNeRM:ref ] 

  

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

  

  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Do Not Reply <donotreply@republicservices.com> 
Date: Fri, Oct 16, 2020, 11:48 AM 
Subject: Account Balance Inquiry [ ref:_00DE0IIt1._5004W1YNeRM:ref ] 
To: joe1976jmb@gmail.com <joe1976jmb@gmail.com> 

  

 

  

10/16/2020  
 
Dear , 
Joseph Bauer 
Thank you for contacting Republic Services regarding your account with 
us.  
 
The current account balance of $99.43 is due on 10/25/2020. This amount 
covers your regular service charges 10/1/2020 through 12/31/2020. 
 
Account number 309230074367 is currently paid up today with last payment 
being received on 7/23/2020 of $124.23 
 
Account number 309230073370 closed 9/10/2019 is also paid in full last payment 
received on 10/24/2020 of $78.41  
 
For further questions and assistance, please call us at 1-844-737-8254 or 
contact us online at RepublicServices.com  with your case number: 
20201016-113151398.   
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Thank you for being a valued customer.  
 
Sincerely,  
Ashley  
Republic Services Customer Service Team  

  

 

  
  

  

 


