Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Jon La Fond <lafond79@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, October 26, 2020 9:49 AM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul)
Subject: Re: Assessment fees per Voice Mails

Alright i recieved both statements in same envelop and mailed both statements in same envelope with payments both
ticket stubs for street and sewage was included thr intent was for both to be paid. Thanks!
Jonathan LaFond

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Monday, October 26, 2020 10:47 AM

To: Jon La Fond <lafond79@hotmail.com>

Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Assessment fees per Voice Mails

It looks like we received your check in the amount of $201.38 but it was applied to your Storm Sewer Charge on
9/9/2020. | will apply the $100.00 to your Sweeping and Lighting charge now.

From: Jon La Fond <lafond79 @hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, October 26, 2020 9:38 AM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Assessment fees per Voice Mails

My address is 594 Humboldt ave St. PAUL, MN 55107. | paid the total asked due!!!

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Monday, October 26, 2020 10:34 AM

To: Jon La Fond <lafond79@hotmail.com>

Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Assessment fees per Voice Mails

What is your address so | can see if your payment has been received and processed.

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Monday, October 26, 2020 9:22 AM

To: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Assessment fees per Voice Mails

From: Jon La Fond <lafond79 @hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, October 26, 2020 9:11 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Assessment fees per Voice Mails




Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone.

-------- Original message --------

From: "Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)" <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Date: 10/26/20 8:34 AM (GMT-06:00)

To: lafond79@hotmail.com

Subject: Assessment fees per Voice Mails

Hello Mr. Lafond,

We received your voicemails dated 10/23 at 3:04 and 3:07 pm. Please referenced your property address, file numbers
and assessment numbers on the notice(s) so | can look into further. Thanks.

Mai Vang

Legislative Hearing Coordinator
Saint Paul City Council

15 W Kellogg Bvd, Ste. 310

Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8563

0: 651-266-8585

F: 651-266-8574
mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us

The Moar Loeabie
Ty in Amor<a

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America






