Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Burger, Kathryn (Cl-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, August 13, 2020 8:07 AM

To: Moermond, Marcia (Cl-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: APPEAL Alan Hausladen

FYI. This is for next week’s hearing on 103 Magnolia.

Katie Burger
Executive Assistant

Saint Paul City Council

15 West Kellogg Boulevard, Suite 310
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8567

F: 651-266-8574
kathryn.burger@ci.stpaul.mn.us

Thae Mot Livable

k
City In America ﬁu ﬁ

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America

From: alanhausladen2000@yahoo.com <alanhausladen2000@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 13, 2020 6:36 AM

To: Burger, Kathryn (CI-StPaul) <kathryn.burger@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; alan hausladen <alanhausladen2000@yahoo.com>;
Kim Anderson <kanderson1288@gmail.com>

Subject: APPEAL Alan Hausladen

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Dear Sir,

| have APPEAL set for August 18, 2020.

| am having MEDICAL (brain issues) that make it very difficult to understand.

| want to know if the APPEAL BOARD can call Kim Anderson at 651-497-1808

to handle the APPEAL

| will also be there by she will be answering questions

that is helping me with these inspection issues.

| did file a EVICTION NOTICE UNLAWFUL DETAINER with the court in ST PAUL
on MONDAY august 10, 2020 as the Tenants in the Basement refuse to leave

this was Done By Kim Anderson on my behalf, | was with her at the Court house
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to sign the eviction papers and pay the Filing fee of $300.00
See attached papers

Thank you

Alan

612-454-6930



Payor

OFFICIAL RECEIPT
Second Judicial District
District Court Records
15 West Kellogg Boulevard, Room 72
St Paul MN 55102

Hausladen, Alan
103 Magnolia Ave W
St. Paul, MN 55107

Receipt No.
RC62-2020-04466

Transaction Date

08/10/2020
[ Description Amount Paid |
Hausladen, Alan
62-HG-CV-20-793
Alan Hausladen vs Emiliano Roman, Lindsey Schilling
Civil Filing Fee 300.00
SUBTOTAL 300.00
Remaining Balance Due: $0.00
PAYMENT TOTAL | 300.00 |
Debit/Credit Card (Ref #04477B) Tendered 300.00
Total Tendered 300.00
Change 0.00
08/10/2020 Cashier Audit
10:40 AM Station WCIVIO05 1659175004

OFFICIAL RECEIPT
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RAMSEY COUNTY COURT
15 KELLOGG BLVD W
SAINT PAUL, MN 55102
651-266-8262
RAMSEY COUNTY MAIN CH
Date: 08/10/2020 10:38:15 AM

CREDIT CARD SALE

MASTERCARD

CARD NUMBER: Kkrxkkx k%3026 K
TOTAL AMOUNT: $300.00
APPROVAL CD: 04477B

RECORD #: 000

CLERK 1ID: gomezn

Case File Number: 62-HG-CV-20-793

Thank You!

Customer Copy

hitps://www.convergepay.com/converge-webapp/ 8/10/2020




