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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, July 21, 2020 10:31 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: St Anthony Green Trash MAJOR ISSUE

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

That is correct. 
 
cs 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 21, 2020 10:26 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: St Anthony Green Trash MAJOR ISSUE 
Importance: High 
 
Are we removing this charge because it was sent to the property owner and not the homeowners association? Please let 
me know as soon as possible. 
 
Thank you! 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, July 20, 2020 4:17 PM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: St Anthony Green Trash MAJOR ISSUE 
 
Hi!  
 
This $3 assessment is a Q1 2020. We need to remove this charge. Can you enter a TA file for this? Thanks 
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chris 
 

From: Sue Thaxton <SThaxton@cedarmanagement.com>  
Sent: Thursday, July 9, 2020 1:40 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pam Pittman 
<ppittman@cedarmanagement.com> 
Cc: Sue Thaxton <SThaxton@cedarmanagement.com> 
Subject: St Anthony Green Trash MAJOR ISSUE 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Chris, the owner at 2329 Ellis got a notice from the city that they are going to assess $3 to her taxes for the trash. Sorry, 
but that isn’t legal.  Her number is 651-644-3529.  You need to contact her and discuss this.  What the hell is going 
on?  This is ridiculous and she is elderly so she doesn’t understand and thinks we are lying when we say we are paying 
the invoices. 
 
I need you to call her and I need a response on this. I will give you all the other addresses at the property so you can find 
out what else the city is doing that is illegal because the association has paid the bill. 
 
Sue Thaxton 


