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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, July 7, 2020 8:56 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul); Moser, Lynn (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: Assessment payment for 663 LINCOLN AVE

Q1 2020 amt 413.17 has not been paid. 
Q4 2019 amt 279.81 was paid on 1/24/2020. 
Q3 2019 amt 12.16 has not been paid. 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 7, 2020 8:45 AM 
To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Moser, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <lynn.moser@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Assessment payment for 663 LINCOLN AVE 
 
Hello Tanya and Lynn, 
 
Could one of you check to see if there was a payment made for an assessment on this property from January – March 
2020? If so, could you include the date that this was paid as well as the amount? 
 
Thank you! 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 
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