Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Valerie Shirley <valerie.shirley@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, June 29, 2020 4:56 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Subject: Re: Please send payment history for Advanced Disposal
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

WELLS FARGO Q | 8 sinon

Accounts - Brokerage Transfer & Pay ~ Plan 8 Learn -
#& Account Summary Switch Account ™
@ 06/02/20 PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 06/01 ADVANCED DISPOSAL B66-496-5780 FL

5460153577203789 CARD 8443

@

5 05/04,/20 PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 05/01 ARMBNEED DISPOSAL B66-496-5780 FL
5580122577083266 CARD 8443

@ 04/02/20 PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 04/01 NBMBNEED DISPOSAL 866-496-5780 FL
S580092576752612 CARD 8443

@ 02/04/20 PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 02/03 EDVENCEDIDISPOSAL ~c6-496-5780 FL
5380034613112917 CARD 8443

*

P 12/03/19 PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 12/02 NEVANCEDIDISPOSAL 556-496-5780 FL
S589336613618481 CARD 8443

@ 11/04/19 PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 11/01 KENANCEGIBISPGSAL 556-496-5780 FL
5589305577348453 CARD 8443
@ 09/03/19  PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 05/02 NDVANCEDIDISPOSAL 555-456-5780 FL
5469245577291530 CARD 8443
@ os/02/19 PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 08/01 KDNSANCEDIDISPOSAL 566-496-5780 FL

S469213577457067 CARD 8443

@® 06/04/19 PURCHASE AUTHORIZED ON 06/03 ADMANCEDIDISPOSAL 566-496-5780 FL
5389154577193789 CARD 8443

On Mon, Jun 29, 2020 at 4:54 PM Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Per our conservation, please send the complete history of payments from October 2018 — June 2020.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862
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