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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, August 11, 2020 10:05 AM
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: Assessment -  887 Selby Ave. 

Please add to both TA files for 887 Selby Ave that are scheduled for today’s Legislative Hearing. 
 
Thank you! 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, August 6, 2020 11:30 AM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
 
Hi Clare, 
 
As requested in the hearing, I have called Ms. Doyle back about and additional information on payments to the haulers. I 
have been unable to get ahold of her. I called on the following days: 
 
Friday, July 31st, 2020 
Monday, Aug 3rd, 2020 
Thursday, Aug 6th, 2020 
 
I have not heard anything more from Ms. Doyle. 
 
Chris 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 2:56 PM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
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I agree with that recommendation. 
chris 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 2:48 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
 
As a courtesy to the resident I am going to remove the late fees for both assessments. Just an FYI. Let me know if you 
disagree. 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, July 27, 2020 11:23 AM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
 
I have spent the las 2 hours trying to get in contact with someone from the SPPD to have an officer follow up with this 
resident as she maintains that someone has been stopping by the house and taking payment directly.  
 
We should send an inquiry to RS for any record of contact or payments. 
 
Ms. Doyle does want a call for the hearing. 
 
Chris  
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 24, 2020 4:46 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
Importance: High 
 
Hey Chris,  
 
Could you call me about this on Monday when you get a chance? 
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Thanks! 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Friday, July 24, 2020 2:01 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
 
This is Jean Doyle. How do we want to handle this one? 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 24, 2020 10:43 AM 
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) 
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
 
Q4 2019 was missed on 7/22 Public Hearing Agenda 
Q1 2020 PH is 8/26 
 
Clare, do a TA for Q4 2019 for 7/30 (I will change to SR when I approve the file) 
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And do a TA for Q1 2020, CG2002A1 for 7/30 @ 10.  Need to let her know. 
 
 
 

 

Mai Vang 
Legislative Hearing Coordinator 
Saint Paul City Council 
15 W Kellogg Bvd, Ste. 310 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8563 
F: 651-266-8574 
mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

   Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 
 
 
 
 
 

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2020 4:40 PM 
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
 
3 Delinq Garbage Bills  
Q3 2019 - $69.95 
Q4 2019 - $69.95 
Q1 2020 - $63.36 
 

From: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2020 4:36 PM 
To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
 
Is there an assessment on this property? 
 

From: Assessment_English (CI-StPaul) <Assessment_English@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2020 11:35 AM 
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) 
<mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Assessment - 887 Selby Ave.  
 
My name is Jean Doyle and I’m calling there because I got the letter here, it says it’s a special notice and the City Council 
public hearing and as a matter of fact I always pay my bills all the time.  I always pay my light and gas and whatever.  But 
I’d like to know is what’s going on because they have me call 651-266-6804.  I don’t know what for but I got the public 
hearing and I don’t know what’s going on because I pay my rent all the time and my house payments all the time and I 
have missed no days.   Would you call me and let me know my number is 651-224-2646.  I would like to know what’s 
going on.  All right, and thank you so much. Bye bye. 
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FYI…I called Jean Doyle to get her address because it was not left on the VM.  She did not have her assessment number 
handy. 
Janis 
 

From: +1 651-224-2646 <+1 651-224-2646>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 4:09 PM 
To: Assessment_English (CI-StPaul) <Assessment_English@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Voice Mail (1 minute and 12 seconds) 
 
You received a voice mail from DOYLE JEAN. 
 

 

Set Up Voice Mail 


