Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 11:05 AM

To: Swanson, Christopher (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 1598 HAZEL STREET NORTH (Q1 2020) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Clare,
Please see update from Beth.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Gene's Disposal <genesdisposal@qgwestoffice.net>

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 10:27 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: 1598 HAZEL STREET NORTH (Q1 2020) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

We received no payment for this account for the 1° Quarter of 2020. The first payment we received from him in 2020
was in May for his 2" quarter bill.
Last payment before the May payment was in November 2109 to pay his 4™ quarter 2019 bill.

Thanks,

Beth

Gene’s Disposal

651-426-1224, Mon- Fri, 8 am —4:30 pm

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 9:55 AM

To: genesdisposal@qwestoffice.net; Lisa Wegleitner

Cc: gwegleitner@gwestoffice.net

Subject: FW: 1598 HAZEL STREET NORTH (Q1 2020) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Beth,
Please see information and request below.

Greg Reveting

Chief Manager



St. Paul Haulers LLC.
grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Monday, July 13,2020 9:37 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 1598 HAZEL STREET NORTH (Q1 2020) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Please forward to Gene’s Disposal:

Property Address & PID: 1598 HAZEL STREET NORTH (PID: 232922210087)

Property Owner: WALTER ) MONTPETIT

Phone Number or Email: 651-776-0491

Pending Assessment Amount: $107.04

Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Garbage Service Medium Cart Weekly; 3 Late Fees; Jan 1-Mar 31 2020

Summary of Issue: Property owner stated that he paid his Q1 2020 bill. Please provide invoice amount and payment
hsitory for Quarter 1 2020. Please provide this information by tomorrow, if possible, as there is a legislative hearing for
this property this week.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works

800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862

F: 651-266-6222
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

D %

www.stpaul.gov/garbage

The Mast Livable
City in Amaerica




