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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Wednesday, July 22, 2020 2:33 PM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul); Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 1374 Van Buren - FW: Voice Mail (1 minute and 8 seconds)
Attachments: audio.mp3

Prep TA for 7/30. I’ll amend AR 
 

From: Assessment_English (CI-StPaul) <Assessment_English@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 22, 2020 2:29 PM 
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) 
<mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 1374 Van Buren - FW: Voice Mail (1 minute and 8 seconds) 
 
Hello. The address I’m talking about is 1374 Van Buren Avenue in St. Paul, and my name is Gigi. And what’s going on is 
that the trash assessment of $37.68 included $4.92 that should not be there because I carry a credit balance. And a year 
ago similar things happened. I came in person to defend myself. Martha allowed me to remove the late fee. And I want 
to email in the supporting documents and I would be on the call as well. So I hope that is enough. And my phone 
number is 612-978-0045. Okay, thank you very much. 
 
 

 

 
Katie Burger 
Executive Assistant 
Saint Paul City Council 
15 West Kellogg Boulevard, Suite 310 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8567 
F: 651-266-8574 
kathryn.burger@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 

 
 

From: +1 612-978-0045 <+1 612-978-0045>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 22, 2020 2:12 PM 
To: Assessment_English (CI-StPaul) <Assessment_English@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Voice Mail (1 minute and 8 seconds) 
 
You received a voice mail from GILCHRISTA YAU. 
 

 

Set Up Voice Mail 


