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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 3:16 PM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 115 Geranium Ave E - Q4 2019 - Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

A note, we do have a record of delivering a cart at the start of the program. I do not see any records of contact with the 
city about not having a cart. 
 
Chris  
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 2:44 PM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 115 Geranium Ave E - Q4 2019 - Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Clare, 
Please see update from Advanced. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Julie Miron <Julie.Miron@advanceddisposal.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 2:42 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Jim Smith <Jim.Smith@advanceddisposal.com> 
Cc: Kim Shannon <Kim.Shannon@advanceddisposal.com> 
Subject: RE: 115 Geranium Ave E - Q4 2019 - Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Customer has not called once to report they don’t have a cart. I will have a route manager verify. 
 
Julie Miron | Office Manager 
 

 
 
309 Como Avenue | St. Paul | MN 55103 
T: 651.287.5280 | M: 612.232.9161| E: Julie.Miron@advanceddisposal.com 
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Connect with us:   AdvancedDisposal.com   Facebook   Youtube
 Clean & Green: Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 10:16 
To: Julie Miron <Julie.Miron@advanceddisposal.com>; Jim Smith <Jim.Smith@advanceddisposal.com> 
Cc: Kim Shannon <Kim.Shannon@advanceddisposal.com> 
Subject: FW: 115 Geranium Ave E - Q4 2019 - Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Julie, 
Please see request below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2020 8:32 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Greg Revering 
<grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: 115 Geranium Ave E - Q4 2019 - Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Any response on this property? Please provide us with a response by today at 2:00 PM.  There is a legislative hearing 
for this property on Thursday. 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, July 27, 2020 9:11 AM 
To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul) <Alisha.Black@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 115 Geranium Ave E - Q4 2019 - Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
Importance: High 
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Please forward to ADS. 
 
cs 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 24, 2020 9:56 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 115 Geranium Ave E - Q4 2019 - Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
Importance: High 
 
Please forward to Advanced Disposal: 
 
Property Address & PID: 115 E. Geranium Ave 
Property Owner: Catherine J Boerner, Trustee (son Gordan Patraw is her son who lives at the property) 
Phone Number or Email:  612-666-1928, gordy@cascadestone.com 
Pending Assessment Amount:  $110.48 
Quarter Pending Assessment is For:  Q4 2019 
 
Summary of Issue: Gordon is authorized on the AD account as he is the resident of this property.  Caller states that there 
has not been a cart at the property for garbage, so they have had to bring their garbage to their company dumpster. 
Please verify the number and size of carts at the property during Q4 2019. 
 
 
 

Alisha Black 
Office Assistant III 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-5692 
F: 651-266-6222 
alisha.black@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 

 

 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 

 


