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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Friday, July 17, 2020 3:49 PM
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 1006 Marshall Ave

Here is Republic’s response regarding 1006 Marshall. 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Friday, July 17, 2020 3:49 PM 
To: 'Greg Revering' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) 
<Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1006 Marshall Ave 
 
Thank you Frances. Since the bill was incorrect, I am going to recommend removing the late fees and reducing the 
assessment to $204.88. 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 
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From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, July 17, 2020 3:36 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) 
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Fwd: 1006 Marshall Ave 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Clare,   
Please see update below.. 

Sent from my iPhone 
 
Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Estrella, Frances" <FEstrella@republicservices.com> 
Date: July 17, 2020 at 3:32:16 PM CDT 
To: "grevering.sph@gmail.com" <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Cc: "Franklin, Romack" <RFranklin3@republicservices.com> 
Subject: 1006 Marshall Ave 

  
Clare,  
                Here is the information you requested on 1006 Marshall Ave  
  
Q4 2019:  
Billed: $204.88 plus late fees        
Paid: $0.00           
Size: 2 90gal trash cart    
  
Please reduce the assessment from $254.69 to $235.60 
  
Please let me know if this makes sense and if you need any other information  
  
  
Frances Estrella  
Billing Coordinator  
  
  
4325 66th St E 
Inver Grove Heights, Mn 55076 
e festrella@republicservices.com 
o 651-286-4588 
w  RepublicServices.com 
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