
1

Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Friday, July 17, 2020 3:28 PM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 309 Aurora Avenue - History of Assessment Payments 

FYI. Please add to TA file. 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 17, 2020 1:43 PM 
To: Moser, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <lynn.moser@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) 
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Re: 309 Aurora Avenue - History of Assessment Payments  
 
Clare - 
 
Here is what I found: 
 
10/15/19   $103.13   Oct-Dec 2018 
                    $229.56   Jan-March 2019 
1/6/20       $   79.51   July-Sept 2019 
3/12/20    $196.00    Oct-Dec 2019  (partial payment; orig bill $258.66) 
 
No delinquent bills prior to those listed here. 
 
P 
 

From: Moser, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <lynn.moser@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Sent: Friday, July 17, 2020 1:03 PM 
To: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
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Cc: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) 
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 309 Aurora Avenue - History of Assessment Payments  
  
Clare, 
  
Tanya is off this afternoon and my LOGIS is down.  I’m forwarding this to Patti so she can check for you. 
  
Thanks, 
Lynn 
  

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 17, 2020 12:56 PM 
To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Moser, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <lynn.moser@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 309 Aurora Avenue - History of Assessment Payments  
  
Hello Lynn and Tanya, 
  
Was there every any payments for the Q4 2019 Delinquent Garbage Assessment for this property?  
  
Also, please provide history of assessment payments from Q3 2019 – Q2 2020. 
  
Thank you! 
  

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

  
  


