Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 2:36 PM

To: *Cl-StPaul_LegislativeHearings; Swanson, Christopher (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-
StPaul)

Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: City's response RE: 1905 Minnehaha Ave. East - #200110 - CG2001C3 - Ward 7

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Left a VM for a call back

Alisha Black

Office Assistant I11

Saint Paul Public Works

800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street

Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-5692

F: 651-266-6222
alisha.black@ci.stpaul.mn.us

£ > Bl

www.stpaul.gov/garbage

The Hﬁsr Livable
City in Amgrica

From: *Cl-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, July 9, 2020 12:14 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: 1905 Minnehaha Ave. East - #200110 - CG2001C3 - Ward 7

Prepare TA for 7/16 LH and CPH 7/22.
If no TA needed, please reply to that effect.

From: Assessment_English (CI-StPaul) <Assessment English@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Wednesday, July 8, 2020 11:25 AM

To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
<mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: 1905 Minnehaha Ave. East - #200110 - CG2001C3 - Ward 7

Hi,

| am just calling on file number CG2001C3 Assessment #200110 property address 1905 Minnehaha Ave. E. | have
concerns with this assessment because | have bank statements showing that | paid $199.28 to the Assessment line on
10-23-2019. I’'m not sure how | go about seeing where your receiving this $110.48. I’'m very confused. If someone could
give me a call back. I'm at #651-334-6816.



Thank you

From: +1 651-334-6816 <+1 651-334-6816>

Sent: Tuesday, July 7, 2020 2:45 PM

To: Assessment_English (CI-StPaul) <Assessment English@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Voice Mail (56 seconds)

You received a voice mail from J HALBERT.

Set Up Voice Mail



