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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com
Sent: Saturday, July 11, 2020 12:00 PM
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 1016 AURORA AVENUE - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry
Attachments: 1016 AURORA AVE.PNG

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Chris, 
Please see attached information. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Highland Sanitation <info@highlandsanitation.com>  
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 3:46 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: 1016 AURORA AVENUE - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Greg, 
 
Attached is the payment history for this address. 
 
The credit adjustment lines are what we do to zero out the balance for the end of the quarter reports. 
 
Please let me know if you need any other information. 
 
Sincerely, 
Brianna 
Highland Sanitation & Recycling 
651-458-0043 
 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 2:28 PM 
To: 'Highland Sanitation' 
Subject: FW: 1016 AURORA AVENUE - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Sue, 
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Please see information and request below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 1:58 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 1016 AURORA AVENUE - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Please forward to Highland Sanitation: 
 
Property Address & PID: 1016 AURORA AVENUE (PID: 352923320058) 
Property Owner: Fannie Faye Neal 
Phone Number or Email:  651-644-7695 
Pending Assessment Amount: $76.02 
Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Garbage Service Q4 Oct 1-Dec 31 2019 
 
Summary of Issue: Property owner stated that they submitted a payment for $100 for Q4 2019 invoice. Please provide 
billing and payment hsitory for Q4 2019 – Q1 2020. This needs to be done by Monday, July 13, if possible, as the 
legislative hearing for this property is next week. 
 
Thank you! 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 


