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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 3:11 PM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Moser, Lynn (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: Delinquent Garbage Assessment Payment for 1905 Minnehaha Ave. East

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

 
Nothing since then has been paid to Assessments. 
Still owing 110.48 Delinq Garbage Oct to Dec 2019 and 2.37 Delinq Garbage Jan to Mar 2020. 
 
 

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 3:07 PM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Moser, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <lynn.moser@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: Delinquent Garbage Assessment Payment for 1905 Minnehaha Ave. East 
 
 
110. 48 Delinq Garbage July to September 2019 
4.80 Delinq Garbage April to June 2019 
84.00 Annual Sweeping and Lighting 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 3:02 PM 
To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Moser, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <lynn.moser@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Delinquent Garbage Assessment Payment for 1905 Minnehaha Ave. East 
 
Hello Tanya and Lynn, 
 
Property owner stated that they made a payment of $199.28 to the assessments office on 10/23/2019. Can you tell me 
what this was for? 
 
Can you also provide me the assessment payment history for this property from 10/01/2019 – Present? 
 
Thank you! 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 
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www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 


