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Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

From: Assessments (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 2:30 PM
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: Delinquent garbage bill Q3 July-Sep 2019 (assessment #190162)

 
 

 

 

Katie Burger 

Executive Assistant 

Saint Paul City Council 
15 West Kellogg Boulevard, Suite 310 

Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651‐266‐8567 

F: 651‐266‐8574 

kathryn.burger@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 
 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America

 
 
From: Saby Labor <saby.labor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 12:38 PM 
To: Assessments (CI‐StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Delinquent garbage bill Q3 July‐Sep 2019 (assessment #190162) 
 
Dear Public Hearing Officials, 
 
My name is Sabrina L Labor and I am the property owner at 925 Thomas Ave W, St Paul, MN 55104 (property ID: 35‐29‐
23‐21‐0078). 
 
I am writing in advance of the public hearing today at 3:30pm for assessment # 190162, file #CG1904E3, agenda #51, 
ver. 4, file # RLH AR 20‐42 regarding my 2019 Quarter 3 garbage bill delinquent payment. 
 
I wanted to apologize for my oversight in not paying my quarter 3 garbage payment on time for the period of July to 
September 2019. I have since resolved the issue by setting up automatic quarterly payments to my checking account, 
effectively transferring the account to my name, and have paid the full delinquent amount on the St Paul Assessments 
website immediately upon receipt of the hearing notice ($124.74).  
 
I was not previously aware of the delinquent balance. Quarter 3 was my first quarter as a homeowner and I have since 
learned how to effectively stay up to date on utilities invoicing and payment schedules for my new home. 
 
I realize my error and will pay any subsequent fees for this delinquency. 
 
Thank you for your time and consideration, 
 
S. Labor 


