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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 2:16 PM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul); Assessments (CI-StPaul); Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: File CG1904D2  Assessment 190157

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

But is he or she appealing? 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 4:27 PM 
To: Assessments (CI-StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) 
<Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: File CG1904D2 Assessment 190157 
 
Apparently the Q3 2019 assessment was for 706 Maryland Avenue East, as indicated by the PID number of 29-29-22-11-
0044 listed on the Public Hearing Notice Ratification of Assessment. Therefore, as the owner, Calvin is responsible for 
paying the assessment. There does not need to be a TA file created for this address. Assessment should be approved. 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Assessments (CI-StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 9, 2020 3:34 PM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) 
<Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: File CG1904D2 Assessment 190157 
 
4Q. Ta for 7/16 LH and 7/22 CPH 
 

From: Calvin Burton <calvinburton1590@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 30, 2020 10:18 PM 
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To: Assessments (CI-StPaul) <Assessments@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: File CG1904D2 Assessment 190157 
 
I have received a Public Hearing Notice Ratification of Assessment on the property located at 704 Maryland 
Ave E for an unpaid garbage bill. I do not own that property.  
 
According to my records I do not have any outstanding garbage bills for my property located at 706 Maryland 
Ave E. It looks to me as if you have made a mistake in the notification of the owner of the property. 
 
Please correct your proposed assessment and bill the correct person. Should this be a typographical error on 
your part, please let me know. I am happy to pay the bills that are my responsibility.  
 
Should you find the error to be in your favor, please correct it and give me the in formation for the garbage 
company to whom I owe the money to, as I do not have any Billings for this service.  
 
Thank you for your time in this matter.  


