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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Wednesday, March 4, 2020 9:07 AM
To: Kedrowski, Richard (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Martin, Lisa (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 463 Wheeler St - 20-013384

Then I don’t think it has been sent to Office of Financial Services yet. 
 
Mai 
 

From: Kedrowski, Richard (CI-StPaul) <Richard.Kedrowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, March 4, 2020 8:27 AM 
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Martin, Lisa (CI-StPaul) <lisa.martin@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 463 Wheeler St - 20-013384 
 
Hi Mai, 
 
It looks like the Work Order was executed on 2/24 and the Invoice was submitted on 3/1. I have attached a snip of the 
Parks Work Order.  
Please let me know if there is anything I need to do for follow-up. 
 
Thanks, 
Dick 
 

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 12:22 PM 
To: Kedrowski, Richard (CI-StPaul) <Richard.Kedrowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Martin, Lisa (CI-StPaul) <lisa.martin@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 463 Wheeler St - 20-013384 
 
Richard, 
I don’t see an assessment for the clean-up you mentioned. 
 
Mai 
 

From: Kedrowski, Richard (CI-StPaul) <Richard.Kedrowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 9:26 AM 
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Martin, Lisa (CI-StPaul) <lisa.martin@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 463 Wheeler St - 20-013384 
 
Good morning Mai, 
 
Somehow, this complaint generated a Work Order instead of a Summary Abatement and Parks did a cleanup on this 
property. I am assuming that I clicked on the wrong box on the App. 
Can you please remove the clean-up fees from this property since they were not notified of the deficiency? 
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Please let me know if you have any questions. 
 
Thanks, 
Dick 
 


