Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 1:37 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: FW: 426 MARYLAND AVENUE EAST - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint
Inquiry

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Clare,
Please see update from Mary.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 1:36 PM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: FW: 426 MARYLAND AVENUE EAST - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

He had $15 in extra bag charges on that invoice.
These charges were clearly noted on his invoice.

2 bagson 7.25.19
2 bags on 8.8.19
1 bagon9.6.19

8381117 10/05/19 MISCTAX INV T1A 8.27 8.27
8381117 10/05/19 MISCTAX INV T1I 23.73 32.00
8381117 10/05/19 INV 06A 69.75 101.75
8381117 10/05/19 INV 06X 15.00 116.75
8381117 10/30/19 FIN CHRG  FIN LPR 5.84 122.59
8381117 11/26/19 FIN CHRG  FIN LPR 5.83 128.42
8381117 01/02/20 FIN CHRG  FIN LPR 5.83 134.25
8381117 01/03/20 ST PAUL BAL PMT MSC 134.25 .00

He has had extra bag charges on all of his invoices since we started an account for him.

Mary Patch



From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 1:27 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 426 MARYLAND AVENUE EAST - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Mary,
Please see information and request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Friday, April 24, 2020 12:43 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: 426 MARYLAND AVENUE EAST - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Please forward to Waste Management:

Property Address & PID: 426 MARYLAND AVENUE EAST (PID: 292922220013)
Property Owner: Vang, Zhoua

Phone Number or Email: 651-279-9996; vangzhoua@gmail.com

Pending Assessment Amount: $134.64

Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Garbage Service Q4 Oct 1-Dec 31 2019

Summary of Issue: It looks like the property currently has 1 64-gallon cart being serviced. Why is the assessed amount
$134.64 when the most that it would be, with late fees, should be $110.48?

Please respond by Tuesday at 10:00 AM as there is a legislative hearing for this property on 04/30/2020.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862
F: 651-266-6222
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

£ > Bl

www.stpaul.gov/garbage

The Maost Livable
City in Amgrica

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.
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