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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Friday, April 3, 2020 9:26 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 981 Mendota - Register Vacant / Pending Assessment

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Hi Clare!  I know that you scheduled this for 4/16, but just wanted to forward to you the additional response that we 
received from Advanced: 
 
AD 4/2/20 response received due to complaint submission:  981 Mendota St. Account has been cancelled, credit 
entered for any outstanding invoices. Containers to be removed 
 
 

Alisha Black 
Office Assistant III 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-5692 
F: 651-266-6222 
alisha.black@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 

 

 
 

From: Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2020 4:01 PM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 981 Mendota - Register Vacant / Pending Assessment 
 
You’re fab!  Thanks! 
 
 

Alisha Black 
Office Assistant III 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-5692 
F: 651-266-6222 
alisha.black@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 
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From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2020 4:01 PM 
To: Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul) <Alisha.Black@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 981 Mendota - Register Vacant / Pending Assessment 
 
Absolutely. I will add it to the hearing on 04/16/2020. Thanks Alisha! 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 
 
 

From: Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul) <Alisha.Black@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 31, 2020 3:58 PM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 981 Mendota - Register Vacant / Pending Assessment 
Importance: High 
 
Hi Clare! 
 
The above P/O called for me to have carts removed that were left at her property and I see that she has a pending Q4 
assessment.  This property has been registered as Vacant with the city since Sept. 2018.  They should not have received 
any billing.  Can you get this removed, please?    
 

 
https://information.stpaul.gov/Buildings-Housing-Economic-Development/Vacant-Buildings-Map/rfbb-x7za 
 
 

Alisha Black  
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Office Assistant III 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-5692 
F: 651-266-6222 
alisha.black@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 

 
 


