
1

Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 9:42 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 2085 Stillwater Ave Hauler Assessment Inquiry

Yes, that is the amount that remined unpaid on the $228.31 for the cost of service for a medium and large cart with a 
late fee. 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 9:22 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 2085 Stillwater Ave Hauler Assessment Inquiry 
 
Thank you Chris! I am confused though. Wasn’t the assessment for $13.15? 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 9:10 AM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 2085 Stillwater Ave Hauler Assessment Inquiry 
 
RS is right, the $228.31 is the cost of service for a medium and large cart with a late fee. The resident should follow up 
with their closing company.  
 
cs 
 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 8:47 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 2085 Stillwater Ave Hauler Assessment Inquiry 
 
Any update on this address? 
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Thanks! 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 24, 2020 3:33 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 2085 Stillwater Ave Hauler Assessment Inquiry 
 
Please send to RS. 
 
cs 
 

From: Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 24, 2020 3:33 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 2085 Stillwater Ave Hauler Assessment Inquiry 
 
Please forward to: Republic 
  
Property Address & PID: 262922420016, 2085 Stillwater Ave  
 
Property Owner:   Christina Moosai 
Phone Number or Email: 612-719-0878 
 
Pending Assessment Amount: $13.15 
 
Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Q4 2019 October -December 
  
Summary of Issue: Resident states she doesn’t believe she should owe this amount. She took ownership mid-
December 2019. She states she then did not receive service for weeks because of problems setting up service 
with the hauler. She stated they issued “all sorts of credits” and said she didn’t owe anything. I did explain she 
is responsible from the date she took ownership. Please provide a billing history for Q42019 and Q12020 for 
this property. Thanks 
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Sarah Haas 
Solid Waste Specialist 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-6216 
F: 651-266-6222 
sarah.haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 


