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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 12:01 PM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 1399 MINNEHAHA AVENUE WEST - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Clare, 
Please see update from Aspen 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Bauman, Cydnee <cbauman@aspenwaste.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 12:01 PM 
To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: 1399 MINNEHAHA AVENUE WEST - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Greg,  
 
There is no service hold on this account. Resident has not called Aspen since 5/14/19 either.   
 
Thank you, 
 
 
Cydnee Bauman 
Customer Service Representative 
Aspen Waste Systems 
612-884-8008 
 
Aspen. The clean, green way. 
www.aspenwaste.com 
 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 11:58 AM 
To: Sanders, Stacey <ssanders@aspenwaste.com> 
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Cc: Bauman, Cydnee <cbauman@aspenwaste.com> 
Subject: FW: 1399 MINNEHAHA AVENUE WEST - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Stacey, 
Please see information and request below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 11:27 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 1399 MINNEHAHA AVENUE WEST - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry 
 
Please forward to Aspen Waste: 
 
Property Address & PID: 1399 MINNEHAHA AVENUE WEST (PID: 272923340087) 
Property Owner: Delta S Irby 
Phone Number or Email:  612-615-5738 
Pending Assessment Amount: $80.90 
Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Garbage Service Small Cart weekly; 3 Late Fees; Oct 1-Dec 31 2019 
 
Summary of Issue: Property owner stated that the property was unoccupied beginning Feb 19, 2019 thru Feb 29,2020 
and stated that as April 13,2020, there have been no garbage collected from my home since Feb 2019. Please check to 
see if there are any temporary service holds or vacancy requests registered for this property. 
 
Thank you! 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 


